
LOCALLY OWNED - CALL US TODAY!

509-992-6692

Buy | Rent | Customize
All sizes, colors & conditions available 

Locally owned & operated 

www.clarkscontainers.com
colten@clarkscontainers.com

17204 E. Sprague Ave, Spokane Valley
www.CrownLineBuilders.com • 509-220-4649

Pole Building & 
Barndominium 
Specialists

Crafting Quality 
Structures That 
Endure...

Deal Directly with the Owner

W
A 

LI
C:

 C
RO

W
N

BL
75

4C
J

North Idaho

Classified Ad Deadline: Wednesday 12pm

May 15-21, 2025

509-922-3456 Call/Text  I  5111 E. Trent Avenue, Spokane  I  www.PacificNW.Exchange  VOL. III NO. 44  I  FREE!

509-869-0976 • CordisDesignsLLC@gmail.com

Custom Design Drawings, Calculations, 
Permit Support & Quick Turnaround!

Cordis Designs, LLC. 

WE DESIGN BUILDINGS 
SHOPS • GARAGES • BARNS • BARNDOMINIUMS
RESIDENCES • WAREHOUSES • AIRCRAFT HANGARS

MAY 30-31
NITRO FUNNY CARS
BB FUNNY CARS
BLOWN ALCOHOL THUNDER

THUNDER NIGHTS

509-738-2985

GET MORE  
DO MORE!

Your Local Dealer

JJRiggsEquipment.com • 685 Elm Tree Dr. Colville

0% Financing on Select Models

OUR CUSTOMERS 
GIVE US 5 STARS

COME DOWN TO PRE- 
MIER AUCTION CENTER 
THIS FRIDAY, MAY 16
We’re the only current live 
auction in the area! A real 
auctioneer, great food, & 
fun times! 674 N. Pleasant 
View in Post Falls! This 
week we are featuring sil- 
ver bullion, gold & sterling 
jewelry, packing & ship- 
ping supplies, high end Lin- 
coln & Miller welders, 
rods, torches, grinders, air 
compressors, saws, milling 
tools, a jointer, large lot of 
pepper gel spray, home fur- 
nishings, artwork, vintage 
& antique collectibles, a 
Yamaha Enduro motorcy- 
cle, bicycles, Western & 
Native decor. Doors open 
at 3pm Friday for preview- 
ing, & bidding starts at 4:- 
30pm. Please visit our web- 
site for more information 
& pictures! www.Premier- 
AuctionCenter.com

 

I BUY OLD STEREOS & 
OLD WATCHES
Looking for receivers, 
tuners, amps, cassette 
decks, reel‑to‑reel, turnta- 
bles, speakers, boom- 
boxes, etc. Also buying 
vinyl records. Call or text 
with pictures, save my 
number! 208‑691‑1073 
Post Falls

FROM OUR CENTURY 
FARM TO YOUR BARN
Top quality alfalfa & or- 
chard grass alfalfa mix hay, 
quality hay for decades in 
Post Falls, 2024 Inventory 
must go! First cut $250, 
second cut $275. Contact 
Jim at 208‑699‑7319

AUCTION NORTHWEST 
IS THE PLACE TO SELL 
YOUR USED EQUIPMENT
Consign for our next on- 
line equipment auction. 
Wondering what we will 
consign? Just give us a call 
at 208‑994‑6003. Located 
at 3156 N. Beck Road, 
Post Falls, we want to 
make your selling & buying 
experience a positive one. 
Check on upcoming auc- 
tions at www.Auction- 
NorthwestLLC.HiBid.com

DAVE’S TRUCK & EQUIP- 
MENT IN SAGLE
We buy & consign equip- 
ment & trucks, and work 
on heavy equipment & 
farm tractors. Call for your 
quote on undercarriage 
parts. In business over 30 
years. 208‑263‑3555 Sagle

2018 CAT 305 E2 EXCA- 
VATOR
Two buckets, hydraulic pin 
grabber, 4 way hydraulic 
blade, only 3100 hours, en- 
closed cab, beautiful & 
ready for your Spring jobs, 
$55,000. Dave’s Truck & 
Equipment, 208‑263‑ 
3555 Sagle

MOTORHOME, FIFTH 
WHEEL, TRAVEL 
TRAILER SERVICE &
Repair. RV Service Techni- 
cian with 30+ years experi- 
ence. We can come to you! 
Fast, professional service 
on all makes & models, rea- 
sonable rates. We also 
move & relocate RVs of all 
types. Call or text, 208‑ 
783‑5229 Post Falls

 

PEACEFUL, PRIME LOCA- 
TION LIVING
This move‑in‑ready 1996 
Marlette in Fruitland 
Park—one of Coeur d’- 
Alene’s most clean, tidy & 
affordable 55+ communi- 
ties—offers unbeatable 
convenience just behind 
Fred Meyer & minutes 
from Costco, Home Depot 
& top medical care. Enjoy a 
2020 roof, lush organic 
garden beds & vibrant sea- 
sonal blooms. Lot rent is 
just $500/ month, includ- 
ing water, sewer, garbage 
& snow removal. Park ap- 
proval required. Open 
House, Sunday, May 18, 
1pm‑3pm. 576 W Myriah 
Loop, Coeur d’Alene. 
Listed by Lisa Ciraulo at 
NextHome 365 Realty. 
Call Erik Linder at Nex- 
tHome 365 Realty for 
more information, 208‑ 
610‑7776

OLDER DOUBLEWIDE 
MARLETTE MANUFAC- 
TURED HOME
3 bedrooms, 2 baths, in ex- 
cellent condition, newer 
roof & newer furnace 
within the last 3 years, 
needs to be moved off it’s 
current lot in Post Falls, 
$50,000. Also have 10 
beautiful acres near Long 
Lake that would be a great 
location for it for 
$140,000. Call or text 
Doug for more informa- 
tion on the home or the 
land. 509‑821‑0513

 

2013 TOYOTA TUNDRA 
4x4, 4 door, V8, #12029, 
$16,930. Call or come test 
drive, TK Auto Sales, 6904 
E Sprague Ave, Spokane. 
509‑242‑3588

THE GREAT NORTH- 
WEST GATHERING CAR 
SHOW IS AT A NEW
Location this year, the 
Coeur d’Alene Casino in 
Worley, Idaho. Friday, Au- 
gust 8 & Saturday, August 
9, online registration 
opens May 20, in‑person 
registration, August 8. Sat- 
urday show, 8am; awards 
at 5pm. Live band, beer 
garden, special hotel room 
rates. Register at www.- 
GreatNWGathering.com

 

CORSO/ AMERICAN 
STAFFORDSHIRE PUP- 
PIES
9 adorable puppies are 
looking for their potential 
person or family to love 
forever, I own both par- 
ents & they are amazing, 
both of them are always 
ready to go hiking, camp- 
ing, walk with me or just 
watch Netflix, they are 
both loved members of 
our family & these babies 
are a perfect blend of their 
sire & dam, they will be 
ready in two weeks, born 
April 3, they will be de- 
wormed, have first shots, 
$650‑ $700. Please text 
my number for more infor- 
mation if you have any 
questions, 208‑702‑2915 
Kamiah

 

STANDARD GOLDEN- 
DOODLE PUPPIES 
Born March 18, $1500. 
208‑308‑6620 Lewiston

 F1B MINI COCKAPOOS
Up to date on vaccinations 
& deworming, pre‑spoiled, 
delivery options available. 
For more information & 
photos, please call 208‑ 
935‑5919 Kooskia 

 

2017 LINK‑BELT 210LX 
LOG LOADER
38’ boom, 52” grapple, 
8000 hours, nice machine, 
$115,000. More pictures 
at www.GreatNorth- 
ernEquip.com or call 509‑ 
535‑4427 Spokane

 

2009 12’x7’ CARGO 
TRAILER
Double axle, 7000 GVWR, 
side door, D rings installed, 
like new, $4900 or best of- 
fer. 208‑310‑0636 
Moscow

 

2005 3500 CHEVROLET 
4x4 
Dually crew cab long box 
pick up, Duramax Allison, 
177,000 miles, great 
shape, $19,500 or best of- 
fer. 208‑310‑0636 
Moscow

 

LANCE TRUCK CAMPER 
1121
11’6”, outdoor cover, solar 
generator, outdoor 
shower, stereo & TV, dry 
shower, microwave, oven, 
bike rack, completely self 
contained. 208‑304‑3488 
Sandpoint

 

TICA REGISTERED BEN- 
GAL CAT 
Bengalmusiccats’ Nik is 
our gorgeous seal lynx 
young male cat, full of en- 
ergy & sweetness, Nik was 
born on December 26, 
2023, & is fully vaccinated 
& neutered. 509‑954‑ 
0519 https://BengalMusic- 
Cats.com
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JStoutAuction.com | 888.230.8840

NO RESERVE  
MONTHLY AUCTIONS:
May 28th & 29th | June 25th & 26th

SALES & AUCTION INDEX
SALES & EVENTS

Now - May 16, 5pm Audri’s Attic Estate Auction www.AudrisAttic.com

May 16 9am-3pm;  
May 17, 9am-1pm VIP Estate Sale 12204 E 38th Ave, Spokane Valley

May 16, 8am-4pm;  
May 17, 8am-3pm Rummage Sale Manito United Methodist Church,  

3220 S Grand Blvd, Spokane

May 16 & 17, 8am-5pm OCD Estate Sale 311 W 18th St, Spokane

May 16 & 17, 9am-3pm Relic Estate Company Sale 1108 North Fox Road, Spokane Valley

May 16, 9am-4pm Audri’s Attic Otis Orchards 
Estate Sale 5221 N. Malvern, Otis Orchards

May 16-May 25,  
9am-5pm Digger Estate Sale 5273C Ford-Wellpinit Road, Ford: Next 

to Ford Post Office

May 17, 8am-4pm Big Garage Sale 318 S. Leatha Ln, Spokane Valley

May 17 & 18, 9am-3pm Garage Sale 16019 Dartford Dr, Spokane

May 23 & 24, 8am-4pm Moving Sale: Several Sales  
on one street 1407 Shamrock, Spokane Valley

May 23 & 24, 9am-5pm; 
May 25, 9am-2pm Garage Sale 11617 E Alki Ave, Spokane Valley

AUCTIONS
May 16, 8am Lakewood, WA Lilac City Towing Auction 10922 Pacific Hwy SW

May 16, 3pm Post Falls, ID Premier Auction Center 
Auction 674 N. Pleasant View

May 19, 11am Davenport, WA Stockland All Class Cattle 1505 12th St

May 21, 11am Spokane, WA Nelson’s Towing Auction 808 E. Houston Ave

May 23 Cottonwood, ID Cottonwood Feeder Sale 2151 Highway 95 N

May 28 Lewiston, ID Lewiston Livestock Feeder Sale 3200 E Main St

May 28 & 29 Online J Stout No Reserve Auction JStoutAuction.com

May 29, 12pm Spokane, WA Always Towing & All About 
Towing Auction 3704 E Everett

May 31 Cottonwood, ID Cottonwood Consignment 
Auction 2151 Highway 95 N

June 7, 9am Deer Park, WA Farm & Ranch Auction More info & address soon, 
509-828-0597

Call: 509-922-3456 or 800-326-2223 
Text: 509-922-3456

5111 E. Trent Ave. Spokane, WA 99212

COME DOWN TO PRE- 
MIER AUCTION CENTER 
THIS FRIDAY, MAY 16
We’re the only current live 
auction in the area! A real 
auctioneer, great food, & 
fun times! 674 N. Pleasant 
View in Post Falls! This 
week we are featuring sil- 
ver bullion, gold & sterling 
jewelry, packing & ship- 
ping supplies, high end Lin- 
coln & Miller welders, 
rods, torches, grinders, air 
compressors, saws, milling 
tools, a jointer, large lot of 
pepper gel spray, home fur- 
nishings, artwork, vintage 
& antique collectibles, a 
Yamaha Enduro motorcy- 
cle, bicycles, Western & 
Native decor. Doors open 
at 3pm Friday for preview- 
ing, & bidding starts at 4:- 
30pm. Please visit our web- 
site for more information 
& pictures! www.Premier- 
AuctionCenter.com

 

DO YOU HAVE OLD 
STEREO EQUIPMENT 
COLLECTING DUST?
We will buy it for cash! 
Pre‑1980’s only, top dollar 
paid in the Northwest 
since 2004. Amps, turnta- 
bles, receivers, reel to 
reels, cassette, 8‑tracks, & 
more! Prompt reliable ser- 
vice! Call or text pictures, 
509‑868‑9022 Spokane

50% OFF STOREWIDE AT 
ADDY SECOND HAND
Any item: kitchenwares, 
tools, hardware, bedding, 
clothing, collectables, 
glassware, power tools, it’s 
all gotta go! Addy Second 
Hand, Located on Hwy 
395 in Addy, WA. Tues- 
day‑ Saturday, 10am‑5:- 
30pm. 509‑935‑4619 

 

10TH ANNUAL VALLEY 
BLUEGRASS FESTIVAL
Thursday, May 29 to Sun- 
day, June 1. Idaho’s popu- 
lar Kentucky Sky Blue- 
grass band will headline 
this year’s “Pickin’ on the 
Clearwater” at Clearwater 
County Fairgrounds in 
Orofino, ID. Presented by 
Lewis Clark Bluegrass Or- 
ganization, the Festival will 
feature 7 additional bands 
& includes music work- 
shops, open mics, food ven- 
dors & lots of jamming! 
Dry camping is available by 
donation. Weekend Pass 
$35, Day Pass $20, 15 & 
under free with paying 
adult. Passes are available 
at the gate or online. 
Schedule & more at www.- 
LewisClarkBluegrass.com 

MARYANN DUFFEY 
HOUSE PACKED FULL OF 
ANTIQUES!
We are uncovering more 
quality antiques! Col- 
lectibles, stoneware jug, 
vintage photos, antique 
mirrors, silverware, bed 
frames, glassware, furni- 
ture, old purses, chairs, ce- 
ramics, Swarovski Crystal, 
dolls, books, quilts, Wedge- 
wood china, prints, lamps, 
photos, so many trea- 
sures! Be sure to preview! 
No reserve, everything 
starts at $1, everything 
will sell to the highest bid- 
der! See our website & 
view all the available 
items, go to www.Au- 
drisAttic.com & click the 
link for details & pictures. 
Items are available for pick 
up after the auction closes 
at the house in Northwest 
Spokane, or we do have 
the ability to ship using a 
local shipping company, at 
your expense. If you are 
the winning bidder, you 
will be emailed instructions

ESTATE SALES & LIQUI- 
DATION SERVICES BY 
JULIE
Houses, shops, buildings, 
barns & farmhouses, pro- 
viding services in all of 
Spokane & surrounding 
small towns. Call today to 
set up an appointment for 
your estate sale, 509‑638‑ 
9393 

OTIS ORCHARDS ES- 
TATE SALE, ONE DAY 
ONLY!
Friday, May 16, 9am‑4pm. 
5221 N. Malvern, Otis Or- 
chards. Barn, shop & 
house! Tools, ladders, 
snowblower, firewood, 
smoker, canning stuff, 
household, furniture, beds, 
rugs, dishes, purses, art, 
etc. Too much to list! www.- 
AudrisAttic.com

WE BUY MODERN TO 
ANTIQUE BOOKS!
Specializing in the rare & 
unusual, most genres & 
subjects wanted, comic 
books too! House calls 
available for larger collec- 
tions. Giant Nerd Books, 
607 W. Garland, 509‑868‑ 
0420 Spokane

16TH ANNUAL UPSCALE 
SALE BY SPOKANE SYM- 
PHONY ASSOCIATES
To benefit the Spokane 
Symphony. 9120 N. Divi- 
sion, Spokane, at the Y on 
North Division in the for- 
mer Rite Aid. We are ac- 
cepting donations for the 
Upscale Sale, until Mon- 
day, May 19, 10am to 2pm 
or call Jeanette Brenner 
for an appointment, 509‑ 
990‑6418. The kinds of 
items wanted for donation 
are: Fine art, including orig- 
inal oil paintings & prints; 
furniture, such as side ta- 
bles, coffee tables, lamp ta- 
bles, & bedroom sets; vin- 
tage furniture; Oriental 
rugs & Asian items; house- 
hold decor & collectibles; 
new small kitchen appli- 
ances, Hummel figurines, 
as well as vases & candle- 
sticks; Glass, including cut 
crystal goblets & de- 
canters; silver & plate, in- 
cluding sterling silver can- 
dlesticks & silver‑plated 
serving pieces; dolls; cos- 
tume & fine jewelry, much 
needed, including pins & 
necklaces; high‑end cloth- 
ing, such as dresses, fur 
coats, & jeans; antique 
linens as well as quilts; 
wood collectibles; Christ- 
mas, including Old World 
Christmas ornaments; 
lamps, bikes, luggage, & 
good garden items. All pro- 
ceeds benefit the Spokane 
Symphony. Special thanks 
to NAI Black Realty Man- 
agement & White Block. 
First Choice offering sale, 
$5 admission for this pre‑ 
sale, Thursday, May 29, 
3pm‑7pm. Sale days, free 
admission each day, Fri- 
day, May 30, 9am‑6pm; 
Saturday, May 31, 9am‑ 
6pm; Sunday, June 1, 
10am‑5pm; Friday June 6, 
9am‑6pm; Saturday, June 
7, 9am‑5pm. Spokane Sym- 
phony Associates is a 501- 
(c)(3) entity, & therefore 
your donation is tax de- 
ductible

EARLY DAY GAS ENGINE 
SHOW & SWAP MEET
Saturday June 28 & Sun- 
day June 29, 2025. An- 
tique engines, tractors, 
trucks, on display & 
demonstrating. Agricul- 
ture items only for swap 
meet. Garfield County Fair- 
grounds & EWAM Mu- 
seum, 99 Fairgrounds 
Road, Pomeroy WA. Free 
to exhibitors & the public, 
camping & food available 
on the grounds. Contact 
Jay at 509‑566‑7027, or 
Roy at 509‑780‑1250 for 
information

 

I BUY OLD STEREOS & 
OLD WATCHES
Looking for receivers, 
tuners, amps, cassette 
decks, reel‑to‑reel, turnta- 
bles, speakers, boom- 
boxes, etc. Also buying 
vinyl records. Call or text 
with pictures, save my 
number! 208‑691‑1073 
Post Falls

THE GREAT NORTH- 
WEST VENDOR MALL 
Has 150 shops inside their 
10,000 sq ft building. You 
can’t believe all the trea- 
sures. Things from 
“yesteryear” as well as art 
crafted by some of the 
finest. Furniture, plants, 
dehydrated candy, stick- 
ers, Nascar, Pokemon, 
macrame, gems, jewelry, 
Country, Contemporary 
art & much more. New 
items enter the store daily 
so shop often. 6206 E. 
Trent, Spokane 509‑413‑ 
1369

Free CPR Certification
21109 Coeur d’Alene River Rd., Wallace
Saturday, May 17, 9:30 AM - 12 PM. Knowing 
CPR benefits everyone. Be prepared to help by 
recognizing cardiac arrest & knowing how to re-
spond quickly. Learn proper chest compressions, 
use of AED, & other life-saving steps. RSVP re-
quired. Call 208-682-3952, or email chiefpmvfd@
outlook.com for more information.

Military Appreciation Night
1349 N. Beck Rd., Post Falls.
Friday, May 16, 4 PM. With racing & fireworks 
at Mode Stadium Stateline Speedway. Free ad-
mission for veterans, active military & Gold Star 
families! Grab your tickets!

5111 E. Trent Ave.
Spokane, WA 99212

Call/ Text: 509-922-3456 
1-800-326-2223

Fax 509-455-7940
Ads@PacificNW.Exchange
www.PacificNW.Exchange
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Featuring... 
• Country Western BBQ Dinner
• No-Host Bar     • Dessert Auction
• Live Auction     • Silent Auction
• Raffle Prizes

• Adults $75 (if purchased by 5/16, includes 1 drink ticket)     
                        $80 (purchased 5/17-5/29, NO drink ticket) 
• Youth   $20 (10 & Under)

MIRABEAU PARK HOTEL
1100 N. Sullivan Rd., Spokane Valley, WA

SATURDAY, MAY 31, 2025 • 4pm-9pm
Doors open at 4pm • Dinner at 5pm

Call 2BU at 509-994-1167 
or go to 2BU Youth Ranch on 

Facebook to order online

See You There!

P L E A S E  J O I N  U S  F O R  2 B U ’ S  2 0 2 5

GIDDY UP DON’T GIVE UP!

MANEMANE
A N N U A L  F U N D R A I S E R  D I N N E R

Event PUZZLE SOLUTIONS

 

COME DOWN TO PRE- 
MIER AUCTION CENTER 
THIS FRIDAY, MAY 16
We’re the only current 
live auction in the area! A 
real auctioneer, great 
food, & fun times! 674 N. 
Pleasant View in Post 
Falls! This week we are 
featuring silver bullion, 
gold & sterling jewelry, 
packing & shipping sup- 
plies, high end Lincoln & 
Miller welders, rods, 
torches, grinders, air com- 
pressors, saws, milling 
tools, a jointer, large lot of 
pepper gel spray, home 
furnishings, artwork, vin- 
tage & antique collectibles, 
a Yamaha Enduro motorcy- 
cle, bicycles, Western & 
Native decor. Doors open 
at 3pm Friday for preview- 
ing, & bidding starts at 4:- 
30pm. Please visit our 
website for more informa- 
tion & pictures! www.Pre- 
mierAuctionCenter.com

FARM & LIVESTOCK 
EQUIPMENT CONSIGN- 
MENT AUCTION
Rowland Auction Service, 
Saturday, May 31, Cotton- 
wood, Idaho. Consign 
early for website advertis- 
ing! Office, 208‑962‑3284. 
Dennis Rowland, owner: 
cell 208‑983‑7400; Brent 
Rowland, owner: cell 208‑ 
451‑4415 www.Cotton- 
woodLivestock.com

IT IS THE INTENT OF 
THIS PUBLICATION
Not to discriminate be- 
cause of Race, Color, Reli- 
gion, National Origin, Sex, 
Age or Handicap. Job seek- 
ers are encouraged to ap- 
ply for any position for 
which they feel qualified, 
regardless of gender‑spe- 
cific titles

VIP ESTATE SALE
Friday, May 16, 9am‑3pm, 
Saturday, May 17, 9am‑ 
1pm. 12204 East 38th 
Ave, Spokane Valley, WA. 
Full house! Couches, love 
seat, recliners, coffee 
table, occasional tables, 
end tables, lamps, mirrors. 
Ethan Allen American Tra- 
dition dining table/chairs, 
farm house kitchen 
table/chairs. Beds with 
queen & double mat- 
tress/box springs, 
dressers, night stands. 
Wall clocks. Books, book 
cases. Desks, Secretary. 
Canon K921 photocopier, 
Brother electric type- 
writer. Art, including small 
bronzes. New small appli- 
ances, Keurig, Turkish cof- 
fee grinder, Corelle dishes, 
MCM Franciscan, George 
Foreman grill. Small chest 
freezer. Quilts, daily linens. 
Women’s and men’s cloth- 
ing, shoes and purses. Lug- 
gage. VCR & DVD players. 
Twin roll‑away. Jewelry. 
Pocket knives, BB gun, 
new weather station. Col- 
lectibles: ducks (including 
a Duck’s Unlimited First 
Washington Water Fowl 
Stamp print, First of Na- 
tion UK Duck Stamp, First 
of Nation New Zealand, 
First of Sweden First of 
Mexico and 1989 USSR 
Duck Stamp print), sheep, 
cats. Trinket boxes. 
Games, puzzles, stuffed an- 
imals, picture frames. Holi- 
day ‑ indoor & outdoor. 
Silk flower arrangements. 
CDs. Air Dyne Ergometer, 
Cardio Glyde, vintage 10 
speed. Fishing poles includ- 
ing Fenwick, fly tys and 
lures. Camping, hunting, 
fishing equipment & cloth- 
ing. Magnifying lights. Golf 
travel case. Hohner Guitar. 
35mm Minolta with acces- 
sories, shelving, patio 
table/ chairs, ladders, small 
hand tools, Honda snow 
blower, small chest 
freezer, vaccuums and 
more of everything! House 
will be for sale in June. 
Please bring your own 
bags, packers & packing 
material. Cash preferred, 
checks accepted. VIP 
TEAM

BUY AN AMAZON OR 
WALMART STORE
Own your own store, make 
15% month on products 
sold! Retire in 18 months! 
For more information, 
please call 509‑263‑6317 
or 509‑230‑2149 Spokane

BECOME A PUBLISHED 
AUTHOR
We want to read your 
book! Dorrance Publishing 
trusted since 1920. Consul- 
tation, production, promo- 
tion & distribution. Call for 
free author’s guide 1‑877‑ 
729‑4998 or visit Dorran- 
ceInfo.com/ads

 

AUCTION NORTHWEST 
ONLINE AUCTION! 
STARTS MAY 30
Accepting consignment of 
equipment, vehicles, tools, 
ATV’s, building supplies, 
trailers & more starting 
April 29. Unsure if we will 
consign something? Just 
give us a call! We strive to 
provide a great experience 
& trusted service to both 
consignors & buyers with 
our Online Equipment Auc- 
tions. We also do online 
auctions for business & es- 
tate liquidations. We are 
located at 3156 N. Beck 
Road, Post Falls, ID. Open 
Tuesday through Friday, 
8am‑4pm. Contact in- 
fo@auction‑nw.com or call 
208‑994‑6003. To regis- 
ter: www.AuctionNorth- 
westLLC.HiBid.com

BUYING ESTATE CON- 
TENTS.
www.AbesDiscount.com  
for details; 509‑939‑9996 
Spokane. Also, buying old 
stuff. Call for flyer www.- 
IBuyOldStuff.com Fair, 
honest & baloney free

 

DRIVERS! LOOKING FOR 
A GREAT PLACE TO 
WORK? $2000 SIGN‑ON
Bonus! Mercer Trucking is 
hiring Regional flatbed 
Class A Drivers, 72 CPM, 
paid stops, paid tarp, home 
weekends. Doubles en- 
dorsement needed, Cana- 
dian entry a plus but not 
necessary. Direct deposit, 
medical, dental, vision af- 
ter 60 days & PTO. Call 
Curtis, Mercer Trucking, 1‑ 
800‑541‑3529 ext. 3. or 
call/ text, 509‑370‑1900 
Spokane

SPOKANE FORKLIFT IS 
HIRING EQUIPMENT 
TECHNICIANS
Must be experienced & fa- 
miliar with heavy equip- 
ment, automotive, aircraft 
or diesel engines. Please 
send your resume to 
Ryan@SpokaneForklift.- 
com or call 509‑868‑5962, 
Ext. 1

 

HIRING A PART‑TIME 
HYDRAULIC REPAIR
Some pickup & delivery. 
Must be able to drive stick 
shift & have a valid driver’s 
license. Experience helpful 
but willing to train the 
right person. Pay depend- 
ing on experience or will- 
ingness to learn. Hy- 
draulics Plus Inc. 509‑536‑ 
9464. Call Monday‑Thurs- 
day, 7am‑5:30pm to ar- 
range an interview
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 Benefits of Having a Pet

 Playing with a  
 pet elevates  
 levels of serotonin

 Helps people  
 socialize

 Provides  
 companionship

 They make  
 you feel safe

 Provides sensory  
 stress relief

 Fulfillment

 Helps decrease  
 blood pressure  
 in stressful  
 situations

 Helps add  
 structure &  
 routine

 Reduces anxiety  
 & depression

 Gives purpose

Introducing  
The Exchange Media
The Exchange is now The Exchange Media — 
same paper, broader reach, and more ways to 
help you connect with your audience.  We’re still 
the Exchange paper you know, but we’re evolv-
ing. As our advertising options have grown to in-
clude more digital and targeted solutions, and as 
we continue to serve communities across a wider 
region, including Tri-Cities, we’re updating our 
name to better reflect all that we offer. 
As always, you can find the trusted Exchange 
online at PacificNW.Exchange or in print and on 
stands Thursdays. If you’re interested in learning 
more about what we offer visit TheExchangeMe-
dia.com to get information about programmatic 
advertising, custom websites, and so much more. 
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DO-IT-YOURSELF KITS

PORT A COVER
ALPINPC947B3

CARPORTS, RV/BOAT COVERS & SHOPS

CALL  
NOW!

Steel Framed for Strength!

or We Can Install for You!

Air Race Classic 2025
The Air Race Classic (ARC) is an annual 

cross-country race held every June that traces its 
roots to the 1929 Women’s Air Derby - the first 
race of its kind in which Amelia Earhart and 19 
other daring female aviators raced from Santa 
Monica, California to Cleveland, Ohio - and this 
year, Felts Field has been named the finish line for 
the 2025 race!

Air Race Classic, Inc. is a nonprofit organization 
dedicated to:
• Encouraging and educating current and future 

women pilots
• Increasing the publics awareness of general 

aviation
• Demonstrating women’s roles in aviation
• Preserving and promoting the tradition of 

pioneering women in aviation.
 Women of all ages, backgrounds and profes-

sions, flying a wide variety of airplanes, continue 
the tradition of women’s air racing. Racers arrive 
a few days prior to the start of the race for pilot 
briefings and airplane inspections. The actual air 
race is four days, with every team taking off in 
order, 30 seconds apart. After the takeoff, teams 
strategize on how many legs of the race to fly 
each day, and which stop along the route they are 
planning on spending the night. Weather, wind, 
terrain and airplane performance all play a role, 
since the race must be flown in daylight hours. 
The teams race against their own handicap, so 
whichever team beats their handicap speed by the 
most, wins. After 2 days of inspections, debrief-
ings, and meetings with the scorer and judges, the 
winners are announced at the final banquet here 
at our very own Felts Field!

Felts Field’s origins trace back to the beginning 
of the 20th century, as one of the earliest airports 
established in the wake of the emerging era of avi-
ation. Join the fun free event Saturday, June 21 for 
Neighbor Day and meet the participants. These 
incredible ladies are our local pilots competing: 
Felts Field Sky Queens, Rachel Skirvin & Sarah 
Roark; All Sports Aviation Ladies, Kathy Main & 
Lisa Smith; Idaho Skies, LaDonna Beaumont & Lisa 
Dodd; and Lilac Ladies, Melinda Denton & Anne 
Anderson.

Melinda Denton & Anne Anderson

A Better Way to Retire!

REVERSE
MORTGAGE

Mutual of Omaha Mortgage, Inc., NMLS ID 1025894. FL Mortgage Lender  
Servicer License MLD1827. ID Mortgage Broker/Lender License MBL-2081025894. 
WA Consumer Loan Company License CL-1025894. These materials are not from,  
or approved by HUD or FHA. www.nmlsconsumeraccess.org  
Subject to credit approval. #1101734560

Larry Waters 
NMLS# 400451
P 208.762.6887
Serving ID & WA

CALL NOW

866.753.9521 Add’l terms apply. Offer subject to change 
and vary by dealer. Expires 3/30/25.

SPECIAL OFFER

Waiving All
Installation
Costs!

Safety. Style.
Stress-Free 
Installation.

DENTAL INSURANCE
from Physicians Mutual In- 
surance Company. Cover- 
age for 400+ procedures. 
Real dental insurance ‑ not 
just a discount plan. Get 
your free Information Kit 
with details! 1‑855‑526‑ 
1060 www.dental50plus.- 
com/ads #6258

ALLIANCE OF THERAPY 
DOGS IS LOOKING FOR 
NEW MEMBERS!
Is your dog friendly & 
shares a smile with every- 
one he or she meets? Does 
he or she bring joy to 
young & old people alike? 
Please consider being a 
part of the Alliance of 
Therapy Dogs, an Interna- 
tional Registry of Certified 
Therapy Dog Teams. Your 
dog just needs to be 
friendly, sociable & know 
basic commands. It doesn’t 
need to be obedience 
trained or had Therapy 
Dog training. Please go to 
www.TherapyDogs.com 
for more information & 
someone will contact you!

INFLATION IS AT 40 
YEAR HIGHS
Interest rates are way up. 
Credit cards, medical bills, 
car loans. Do you have 
$10,000 or more in debt? 
Call National Debt Relief & 
find out how to pay off 
your debt for significantly 
less than what you owe! 
Free quote, call 1‑844‑ 
955‑4930

CASH FOR WATCHES
Buying men’s wrist- 
watches. Honest, discreet 
collector paying cash for 
Omega, Rolex, Seiko, etc.; 
also buying watchmaker 
tools, parts, broken 
watches. Dan 509‑220‑ 
1878

SUNSETTER AMERICA’S 
NUMBER ONE AWNING!
Instant shade at the touch 
of a button. Transform 
your deck or patio into an 
outdoor oasis. Up to a 10‑ 
year limited warranty. Call 
now & save $350 today! 1‑ 
855‑914‑1148

VIAGRA & CIALIS USERS
50 Generic Pills special 
$119. Shipped discreetly 
to your home. 100% guar- 
anteed. 24/7 call now! 
800‑709‑3080

DON’T LET THE STAIRS 
LIMIT YOUR MOBILITY!
Discover the ideal solution 
for anyone who struggles 
on the stairs, is concerned 
about a fall or wants to re- 
gain access to their entire 
home. Call AmeriGlide to- 
day! 1‑833‑399‑3595

 

A FILTHY WAY TO DIE. 
COLLECTED MEMORIES 
OF THE VIETNAM WAR
Mr. Linz interviews over 
60 veterans who served in 
various assignments dur- 
ing the Vietnam War, on 
the ground, in the air, on 
the rivers & canals, & at 
sea off the coast. It also 
contains a discussion of 
how the U.S. became in- 
volved. Available from 
your local bookstore or 
Amazon. Signed copies 
available from www.- 
EdLinz.com

 

DOUBLE THE FUN! 21 
SPEED SHIMANO DUAL 
DRIVE TANDEM BIKE 
& Accessories. “Kent” Dual 
Drive System Tandem 
Bike. 26x2.125 Duro 
Wildlife Bear Tires and 
safety spring rear kick- 
stand. Velo plush front 
seat & wider Pyramid 
plush rear seat. Bell Com- 
pass for front driver, rear 
view side mirror for rear 
rider (no steering). Talking 
a must, 2 adult Bell hel- 
mets with refective safety 
strips & inner cushions 
plus mounted headlight/ 
lantern (needs batteries) ‑ 
required for Hiawatha Mt. 
bike trail, Mullan, ID. Ther- 
mos brand large insulated 
soft side picnic pack.  
Schwinn portable frame 
pump (shown atop front 
seat). Tools ride fine in 
pack’s outer zipper pouch 
(not with food). Garage 
stored, $175 or best offer. 
Leave questions, contact 
message at 509‑893‑8987 
Spokane

START YOUR OWN BUSI- 
NESS TODAY! OWN 
YOUR VERY OWN
Janitorial Fanchise. Van- 
guard Cleaning Systems 
provide back office sup- 
port, equipment, supplies 
& commercial cleaning cus- 
tomers in North Idaho & 
Eastern Washington. Un- 
limited earning potential. 
www.VanguardCleaning.- 
com  https://bit.ly/2O- 
prT4N  Call today, 509‑ 
922‑1499 x102

VENDORS: RESERVE 
YOUR SPACE FOR OUR 3 
PARKING LOT SALES 
Famous Joes! Parking lot 
sales Saturday, May 24, 
June 21, August 16, 10am 
to 5pm. Rent a 10x10’ 
space for only $20 for the 
whole day. These sales usu- 
ally bring lots of buyers so 
sign up soon! Come in to 
Famous Joes Vendor Em- 
porium at 9126 E. Sprague, 
Spokane or call 509‑315‑ 
8648

CIVIL WAR REENACT- 
MENT MEMORIAL DAY 
WEEKEND
Saturday, Sunday & Mon- 
day, May 24, 25 & 26. 
Siemers Farm, 11125 E. 
Day Mt. Spokane Road. 
Saturday & Sunday, 9am‑ 
5pm, battles at 11am & 
3pm. Monday, 9am‑Noon, 
battle at 11am. $10 admis- 
sion, $5 for Kids 6‑17 
years & 55+. Free for kids 
under 5 years & Vets/ Ac- 
tive Duty. www.- 
SpokaneCivilWar.com BUYING OLD STUFF

www.IBuyOldStuff.com or 
call for flyer. Also, buying 
estate contents www.- 
AbesDiscount.com for de- 
tails. Fair, honest & 
baloney free 509‑939‑ 
9996 Spokane

REVERSE MORTGAGE
A Better Way to Retire! 
Call 208‑762‑6887. Local 
representative, free infor- 
mation. Larry Waters, 
NMLS #400451. Mutual of 
Omaha Mortgage, NMLS 
#1025894. (These materi- 
als are not from, or ap- 
proved by, HUD or FHA. 
Subject to Credit Ap- 
proval.) M00MR.1219.23. 
Equal Housing Lender. 
Serving Idaho & Washing- 
ton

PORTABLE OXYGEN 
CONCENTRATOR
May be covered by Medi- 
care! Reclaim indepen- 
dence & mobility with the 
compact design & long‑last- 
ing battery of Inogen One. 
Free information kit! Call 
877‑305‑1535

WANTED
Vintage slot machines, 
jukeboxes, advertising 
signs; Coca Cola machines; 
service station items (gas 
pumps & advertising). Also 
buying 1916 ‑1985 Wash- 
ington & Idaho license 
plates, pairs or singles in 
good/ fair shape. Call 509‑ 
926‑9266 or 509‑999‑ 
9855, dlee40@comcast.- 
net Spokane 

SEARCHING FOR 
CHEAPER WEBSITE 
HOSTING?
We are an affordable ser- 
vice with easy set‑up start- 
ing at only $1.50 per 
month! Self‑service con- 
trol panel, free SSL, man- 
aged email with spam pro- 
tection, free daily backups, 
SSH access & more! For de- 
tails & information go to 
www.SpokaWeb.com

MOBILEHELP AMERICA’- 
S PREMIER MOBILE 
MEDICAL ALERT
System. Whether you’re 
home or away, for safety & 
peace of mind, no long 
term contracts, free 
brochure! Call 1‑888‑489‑ 
3936
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The Coeur d’Alene School District 271 held a celebration 
on May 15, 1952 to dedicate its most recently construct-
ed school building, Borah Elementary. A large crowd 
of school patrons gathered at the new school to partici-
pate in the dedication and tour the imposing ten-room 
school. Construction of the building started in the sum-
mer of 1951. The building was partially occupied by the 
fifth-grade classes in September of that year. It was com-
pleted in the early winter of 1952 at a cost of $259,000. 
The school was named in honor of the late Senator 
William E. Borah. Mrs. Borah sent a large portrait of the 
Senator to the school. Superintendent G.O. Phippeny 
made the official acceptance of the portrait. Kyle Walker, 
representing Mayor Gardener and the Chamber of Com-
merce, made remarks at the dedication.

Coeur d’Alene School

Museum of North Idaho photo EDU-1-79
Information provided by:

museumni.org

HISTORIC PHOTOS  
of 

IDAHO PANHANDLE

WE PAY THE BEST 
PRICES ON GOLD & SIL- 
VER AT COINS PLUS!
Scrap gold, jewelry & dia- 
monds? Call Coins Plus for 
the highest prices in the 
area! We buy & sell. Coins 
Plus, 509‑444‑0044 3201 
N. Division, Spokane. www.- 
CoinsPlus.com

MOBILEHELP AMERICA’- 
S PREMIER MOBILE 
MEDICAL ALERT
System. Whether you’re 
home or away, for safety & 
peace of mind, no long 
term contracts, free 
brochure! Call 1‑888‑489‑ 
3936

COMIC BOOKS WANTED
Paying cash, large or small 
collections, any age but the 
older the better. Fair cash 
offers, call Rob 208‑920‑ 
1362

CONSUMER CELLULAR  
Same reliable, nationwide 
coverage as the largest 
carriers. No long‑term con- 
tract, no hidden fees & 
free activation. All plans 
feature unlimited talk & 
text, starting at just $20/ 
mo. Call 1‑877‑751‑0866

SLOT MACHINES
Buying in any condition, 
also parts. Complete re- 
pairs or restoration ser- 
vice too. Private party, 
509‑922‑2454 Spokane

FROM OUR CENTURY 
FARM TO YOUR BARN
Top quality alfalfa & or- 
chard grass alfalfa mix hay, 
quality hay for decades in 
Post Falls, 2024 Inventory 
must go! First cut $250, 
second cut $275. Contact 
Jim at 208‑699‑7319

 

AEROSHELL FOR AVIA- 
TION PISTON ENGINES
Is at Pacific Petroleum & 
Supply. Promotes engine 
cleanness, reduces oil & 
fuel consumption, an all 
season oil, excellent at low 
or high temperatures. N 
8321 Market, Spokane, 
509‑467‑3130 www.- 
pacpetro.net

HOME BREAK‑INS TAKE 
LESS THAN 60 SECONDS
Don’t wait! Protect your 
family, your home, your as- 
sets now for as little as 
70¢ a day! 1‑844‑591‑ 
7951

 

SHIPPING CONTAINERS! 
BUY, CUSTOMIZE, RENT
Convenient & secure on- 
site storage. Locally 
owned & operated. Call to- 
day for more information. 
Clark’s Containers 509‑ 
992‑6692 www.- 
ClarksContainers.com

OLD GUITARS WANTED!
Gibson, Fender, Martin, 
etc. 1930’s to 1980’s. Top 
dollar paid. Call toll free 1‑ 
866‑433‑8277

 

USE OXYGEN & FED‑UP 
RENTING TANKS ON 
THEIR SCHEDULE?
Take breathing freedom 
back & Own  your equip- 
ment package including 
spare parts! 2023 G5 Ino- 
gen One Oxygen Concen- 
trator & all pictured swag 
keeps you outward bound. 
Great condition! Only 
weighs 5.7lbs including a 
double battery. Powered 
by quiet rechargeable bat- 
teries, or any AC or DC 
power source. Double bat- 
tery lasts 5 hours at set- 
ting 3 Liters/minute! Intel- 
ligent Delivery Technology 
“R” pulse flow 1‑6 Liters/ 
minute! You can use per- 
sonal O.T.C.  nasal cannu- 
las/ tubing, or work with 
your physician/ pharmacy. 
User manual, comfort 
shoulder or hand straps, 
full‑size back pack, 2 inside 
chargers, 1 car charger; 
AC power sensing world- 
wide. Use in home or 
travel by auto/ bus/ train/ 
FAA airplane approved. 
Leave questions, contact 
message at 509‑893‑8987 
$2,345 cash. Spokane

PAYING TOP CASH FOR 
BUILDING LOTS & 
SMALL ACREAGE
In & around the Spokane 
area. 509‑939‑8820

 

DO YOU NEED MORE 
STORAGE SPACE?
Steel Structures America 
can build you a shop or 
barn. We are the largest 
pole builder contractor in 
the Northwest and have 
competitive pricing. Don’t 
wait! Call today, 1‑888‑ 
598‑8166  www.Steel- 
StructuresAmerica.com

GET YOUR INDEPEN- 
DENCE FOR ONLY 
$24.95!
Break the bonds of your In- 
ternet service provider! 
Now available, you@your- 
name.com or you@your- 
business.com & your Inter- 
net access for one low 
monthly price, never be 
forced to change your 
email addresses, 100 Megs 
of web space & nationwide 
high speed Internet access 
with 24/7 tech support! 
Call SISNA at 866‑Go‑ 
Sisna, 866‑467‑4762

 

THEY NEVER THREW 
ANYTHING AWAY
Memories of the Great De- 
pression by Americans 
who lived it. Contains in- 
terviews Mr. Linz did in the 
late 1990’s including one 
with Walt from Walt’s 
Pickups on Sprague in 
Spokane & others from the 
Pacific Northwest. This 
book can be ordered from 
your local bookstore or 
Amazon.com, or directly 
from www.EdLinz.com  
$20 retail

WE BUY HOUSES FOR 
CASH AS IS!
No repairs, no fuss, any 
condition, easy three step 
process: call, get cash offer 
& get paid. Get your fair 
cash offer today by calling 
Liz Buys Houses 1‑844‑ 
877‑5833

PEACOCKS 
Male & female, 1 year old, 
indigo blue, $100 each. 
Call 509‑319‑6164

JACUZZI BATH RE- 
MODEL
Can install a new, custom 
bath or shower in as little 
as one day. For a limited 
time, waving all installation 
costs! Additional terms ap- 
ply, subject to change & 
vary by dealer. Offer ends 
June 30, 2025. Call 1‑844‑ 
501‑3208

DIRECT TV STREAM 
CARRIES THE MOST LO- 
CAL MLB GAMES!
Choice package $89.99/ 
month for 12 months. 
Stream on 20 devices at 
once. HBO Max included 
for 3 months (with choice 
package or higher). No con- 
tract or hidden fees! Some 
restrictions apply. Call IVS 
1‑866‑859‑0405

 

PONDEROSA BACK 
COUNTRY HORSEMEN 
POKER RIDE
A fundraiser for Back 
Country Horsemen of 
Washington, Ponderosa 
Chapter, keeping trails 
open! Raffles & prizes! 
Sunday, June 22 at River- 
side State Park Equestrian 
Area, Spokane. Family 
event, kids 18 & under ride 
free. $30 pre‑registration 
mailed or online by June 
12. Register at event for 
$45 per rider, extra hands 
$5. First riders out at 9am, 
last rider at 11am. Game 
ends at 1:30pm. Prizes for 
best hand, second best 
hand & low ball hand. Dis- 
cover Pass required. On- 
line registration at https:- 
//form.jotform.- 
com/250098671446160 
for more information, 
Linda White, 509‑413‑ 
7392 or Patty Wright, 509‑ 
868‑6269

HAY
4x5’ round bales, meadow 
foxtail, orchard grass, 4x4’ 
Timothy small squares. 
208‑435‑4637 or 208‑ 
435‑4002 Orofino

I BUY HORSES, MULES & 
PONIES
Any breed, any age, any- 
where! Please call or text, 
208‑413‑2192 Asotin

WILL ROGERS HAS ALL 
YOUR SPRING RIDING 
NEEDS
Saddles, tack, helmets, 
great used tack selection, 
consignments coming in 
daily. We have jewelry, 
purses, hats, belts & more! 
Watch our Facebook page 
for daily specials. All major 
credit cards accepted. Buy, 
sell, trade. www.Will- 
RogersSaddle.com  13011 
N. Freya Street, Mead. 
509‑466‑0106

QUALITY GRASS HAY & 
ALFALFA FROM MORRI- 
SON RANCH
Grass hay, $300 ton, first 
cutting Alfalfa, $310 ton. 
Small bales, we guarantee 
every bale! Load Satur- 
days, 8am‑Noon. Call for 
details, Bud, 509‑928‑ 
6427 or Greg, 509‑953‑ 
6958 Greenacres

QUALITY GRASS HAY & 
ALFALFA FROM MORRI- 
SON RANCH
Grass hay, $300 ton, first 
cutting Alfalfa, $310 ton. 
Small bales, we guarantee 
every bale! Load Satur- 
days, 8am‑Noon. Call for 
details, Bud, 509‑928‑ 
6427 or Greg, 509‑953‑ 
6958 Greenacres

 

LIVESTOCK DRINKING 
POST
Fresh, clean water every 
use. Non‑electric, no 
freeze, easy install, de- 
pendable & durable. Re- 
duce your maintenance, no 
slime or algae buildup. Buy 
local, made in the USA! 
Serving Eastern Washing- 
ton & North Idaho. Call to- 
day, 208‑597‑3925 or visit 
BahBahBlackTailFarm.- 
com 

 

26TH ANNUAL TOM 
BYRNE MEMORIAL 
CLINIC & RODEO
Saturday & Sunday, June 
28 & 29, 10am each day, 
1717 W. Dynamite Lane, 
Spokane. $300 per rider, 
horses may be provided 
for an additional fee. Satur- 
day: Horsemanship, bar- 
rels & poles with Jim 
Parvin; Sunday: Memorial 
Rodeo & Queen tryouts, 
awards ceremony, buckles 
for beginners, intermedi- 
ate, advanced & Sports- 
manship Saddle. Lunch 
provided each day. For 
safety reasons, children 
under age 10 are not al- 
lowed to attend or partici- 
pate. All checks must be 
written to Pittmann Land 
& Livestock. Call 509‑370‑ 
9843 or email: 
justincpittmann2015@g- 
mail.com

 

PROTECT YOUR ANI- 
MALS FROM ALL  OF NA- 
TURE’S ELEMENTS!
Get best pricing for your 
new barn.  Steel Structures 
America, NW Largest Pole 
Building Contractors, 1‑ 
888‑598‑8166   www. 
SteelStructuresAmerica. 
com

TOP DOLLAR PAID FOR 
GOOD USABLE HORSES
All classes, no wild or unus- 
able horse! Will also buy 
mares & ponies, need to be 
gentle, aged 3 to 12 years. 
Call Frank Dillon, 208‑750‑ 
6500 Lewiston

Memorial Day Observance
McIntire Family Park - 8930 N. Gov’t Way, 
Hayden
Presented by the City of Hayden, honor the men 
& women who sacrificed their lives in service to 
our country. 9:30 am - wreath-laying ceremony at 
Honeysuckle Beach on Hayden Lake. 11 am - re-
membrance ceremony at McIntire Family Park. 
Be sure to visit PFC Robert J. Gordon Veterans 
Memorial Plaza in front of Hayden City Hall, 196 
W. Hayden Avenue. More information  208-209-
1080

American Heroes Day
Silverwood Theme Park - 27843 Hwy 95, Athol, 
ID
Saturday, May 24 through Monday, May 26. All 
military personnel, veterans, firefighters, police 
officers, & EMS receive Free admission identifica-
tion/ proof required! Details & special weekend 
deals at https://www.silverwoodthemepark.
com/events/ 
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I have seen real improvements in a 
variety of fisheries in the region. The 
action has really picked for kokanee, 
walleye and bass. I have had a chance 
to get out and sample some of these 
opportunities and plan to ramp up my 
activity on the water to take advantage 
of more of them.

If you are following my reports on 
my website, on the radio, newspaper 
and videos, you have heard that the 
kokanee fishing on Lake Chelan has 
become hot. The fish aren’t big, but it 
is a ton of fun catching a bunch. It’s a 
great time to get the kids out in the 
boat for fast action. There are some 
other lakes that you can find kokan-
ee in, and this is a good time to fish 
for them. Not far from Lake Chelan 
is Wapato Lake, just up over the hill 
from Manson. It is known to produce 
large kokanee, sometimes 16 inch-
es. The public ramp at the east end 
of the lake is in bad shape, but small 
boats can launch here easily. There 
is another at the Rainbow Resort at 
the other end of the lake. It is nar-
row, though. Fish Lake, near Lake 
Wenatchee, has had kokanee in it for 
a few years now. You will find them 
trolling shallow. Deep Lake, at Sun 
Lakes above Park Lake, may have 
kokanee up to 14 inches in it this 
year. There are some other kokanee 
lakes in the region I will suggest to 
you in future reports.

When I got a call from my friend 
Brian Anantatmula about hot fishing 
for kokanee on Lake Chelan, I imme-
diately made a plan to get up there. 
Tom Verschuren was eager to join me. 
We both enjoy fishing for kokanee on 
Lake Chelan, and this would be his first 
opportunity to do so this season. We 
left the launch at Mill Bay, and when 
we hit 100 feet of water, I turned the 
boat down lake. We got a couple of fish 
and kept on moving. When we got to 
an area below Rocky Point, where we 
have found fish before, we finally start-
ed seeing good numbers on the Garmin 
fish finder. I adjusted the depth on the 
Scotty downriggers to just 50 feet, and 
the back rods to 75 feet with four-ounce 
lead balls for weight. I found that adjust-
ing the speed on the Minn Kota from 1 
mph to 1.4 and then dropping it back to 
1 frequently helped tempt the kokanee 
to strike. Our catch rate soared, and we 

put 20 kokanee in the cooler. Big num-
bers of small kokanee that were 8 to 11 
inches long have moved into the lower 
basin on Chelan.

One of my favorite fisheries in the 
region is for smallmouth bass at Cres-
cent Bar. I have landed some really nice 
pre-spawn fish early in the month of 
May. I just stumbled onto this a couple 
of years ago. I remembered finding lots 
of smallmouth here fishing with my 
brother Rick and cousin Greg probably 
30 years ago and just decided to give it a 
try. My brother in law Tom Verschueren 

loves catching 

bass and was willing to go along on 
our first exploratory mission. We had 
a blast, catching 20 plus smallies. We 
tried our usual method of creeping up 
the shoreline on the Minn Kota. I would 
watch the Garmin for ridges and drops, 
and we would cast plastics to the shale 
slides along the shore without success. I 
was frustrated and about to give up, and 
I thought, what the heck, let’s troll some 
crank baits and see what we catch. Sur-
prise, surprise, the smallmouth jumped 
on them! We have gone back a few 
times and repeated this experience. I 
just hope I am not too late, and the fish 
have already spawned. I have heard that 
it has been good recently. This week’s 
photo is of one of the smallmouth that 
we have caught trolling cranks at Cres-
cent Bar.

This is the time of year, the flows 
of the Columbia River vary consider-
ably. It is important to know the con-

ditions on the river before you launch 
your boat for a day on the water. Both 
recreational boaters and anglers should 
have the Currents App downloaded to 
their phones. The app will give you ac-
cess to a range of information, like lake 
levels, river flows and even fish counts. 
The app is provided by Chelan Coun-
ty PUD, has been recently updated and 
is free! It has a simple map-based de-
sign, and modern look and feel. It has 
interactive touchpoints for users to 
find more details about each park, boat 
launch, river, lake or dam. It also fea-
tures an easy to find menu with items 

for lake levels, river flows and 
fish counts. To learn more about 
the Currents App and to find the 
instructions on how to download 
it to your phone, go to my website 
at FishingMagician.com and look 
for the Ready, Check, Launch 
banner on the right hand side of 
the Home Page. This app is very 
important at all times when boat-
ing anywhere on the Columbia 
River near Rock Reach and Rock 
Island dams. Check it out.

It’s hard to make a choice on 
where to go for some good fish-
ing right now. There are so many 
great options. Trout fishing on the 
region’s lakes that opened recently 
should be terrific. There’s a couple 
of places that should be excellent. 
Park Lake, north of Soap Lake, was 

keeping trout anglers busy, both from 
the shore and from boats. Jameson Lake 
in Douglas County was also producing 
well with stringers of very nice rainbow 
from the shore. Near Wenatchee is Bee-
hive Reservoir, and thanks to a gener-
ous plant of trout this year, the fishing 
has been very good. Out of all of the 
walleye lakes in the region, Mose Lake, 
as usual, is producing the best catches 
in the spring. Fishing for smallmouth 
bass in the lakes has always been good, 
and from what I have experienced so 
far, it could be outstanding. I am going 
to dedicate a few days to smallmouth 
fishing on Moses Lake. I also plan on 
giving Banks Lake a try for both wall-
eye and smallmouth bass very soon. 
Anglers looking for big largemouth 
bass should find them on Potholes Res-
ervoir. Judging by the numbers we were 
catching here last fall it should be great 
this spring.

Reach Dave @ www.FishingMagician.com or FishBoy@nwi.netReach Dave @ www.FishingMagician.com or FishBoy@nwi.net

GET CURRENT FISHING INFORMATION AT....

Reports • Videos • Product Reviews
Free Quarterly E-Letter

FishingMagician.com

Facebook: FishingMagician.com • E-mail: Fishboynwi.net

Get Current Fishing Information at
FishingMagician.com

Reports • Videos • Product Reviews 
Free Quarterly E-Letter

E-mail: Fishboynwi.net • Facebook: FishingMagician.com

LEWISTON VFW POST 
10043 GUN SHOW 
Saturday, May 31, 9am‑ 
5pm & Sunday, June 1, 
9am‑3pm, admission, $5. 
1104 Warner Avenue, 
Lewiston, Idaho

FIREARMS ATTORNEY
Rights restoration, Ex- 
pungement, NFA trusts. Li- 
censed in Idaho & Wash- 
ington. Free consultation, 
Alan Baker, 208‑743‑5338

BUYING GUNS
One gun or collections, 
small or large, along with 
related items. Honest, ex- 
perienced evaluations & 
fair prices. 208‑781‑9034

WINCHESTER, HENRY, 
DERRINGER ESTATE
We buy & consign guns. 
Sure Shot Guns & Pawn, 
Tuesday‑Saturday, 114 N. 
Main St, Kittitas, exit 115 
off of I‑90. 509‑968‑4867

HAVE HUNTING LAND 
FOR LEASE? 
Give us a call to place your 
ad today! Your customer 
could be in our next Brag- 
ging Board!

  HOW TO SPOT A

SCAMMER
	Offering MOre Than YOur asking Price 
 If it sounds too good to be true it probably is.

	if TheY ask YOu TO Wire TheM funds 
 Just don’t.

 if iT invOlves shiPPing The iTeM 
 Always deal locally and face to face.

 dOn’T accePT cashier/ cerTified checks  
 Or MOneY Orders 
 If it’s a fake the bank will hold you responsible.

 TheY ask YOu fOr a dePOsiT 
 Purchasing sight-unseen may mean the item doesn’t  
 exist or isn’t in the expected condition.

	TheY ask fOr YOur Banking infO 
 Never give out your sensitive financial information.

 GOLDENDOODLE PUP- 
PIES 
7 weeks old, first & second 
shots & dewormed, par- 
ents both OFA & CAER, 
DNA & Orivet genetics 
tested, lots of early train- 
ing including kennel, car, 
retrieving, outdoor potty, 
exposed to sheds, duck 
hunting, love water, raised 
with farm animals & kit- 
tens, $850. Delivery avail- 
able, please text, 509‑822‑ 
9888

PUREBRED CHESA- 
PEAKE BAY RETRIEVERS 
Loyal companions & amaz- 
ing hunting partners, 2 
males & 3 females, $1000. 
Call 509‑596‑6379 
Prosser
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John is one of the many cats 
available for adoption at the 
Companions Animal Center. 
Come in today to meet him and 
other cats in need of a home.
Contact one of your local 
shelters today and make a new 
friend!
• Companions Animal Center: 
 208-772-4019 or visit  
 CompanionsAnimalCenter.org
• Second Chance Animal Rescue:  
 208-267-7504 or  
 SecondChanceAnimalAdoption.com

ADOPT A SHELTER CAT!

Please Spay or Neuter Your Pets!

  1. Two-person German 
submarine
  6. 60-minute intervals 
(abbr.)
  9. Database management 
system
 13. Vertical position
 14. American jazz singer 
Irene
 15. Ancient Greek City
 16. Former Senate Majority 
Leader Harry
 17. Japanese seaport
 18. Self-immolation by fire 
ritual
 19. Assigns tasks
 21. Beloved type of cigar
 22. Discounts
 23. Cambodian communist 
leader Pot
 24. Important football 
position
 25. Kilometers per hour
 28. Lentil
 29. Extremely angry
 31. Yellow-flowered Europe-
an plant
 33. American state
 36. Some are made by 
rabbits
 38. Express with a head 
movement
 39. Affair
 41. Cured
 44. Youth organization
 45. 18-year astronomical 
period
 46. Automobile
 48. Focus a shot
 49. The NFL’s big game 
(abbr.)
 51. Mouth
 52. Infections
 54. Curved pieces of a horse 
collar
 56. Shameless
 60. Assist in escaping
 61. Capuchin monkey genus
 62. Cold wind
 63. Retired Brazilian NBAer
 64. Tropical Old World tree
 65. Bulgarian city
 66. Speak indistinctly
 67. Soviet Socialist Republic
 68. Between-meal sustenance

   1. Not soft
  2. Sharp-pointed dueling 
sword
  3. Line a roof
  4. Greek god of the under-
world
  5. Software
  6. Large-headed elongated 
fishes
  7. Shag rugs
  8. Type of whale
  9. Lacking a plan
 10. Spill the beans
 11. Some is “heavy”
 12. One who has been 
canonized

 14. Indicate times
 17. Greeting
 20. Broadway actor Josh
 21. Seashore
 23. Indicates before
 25. Electrical power unit
 26. Destitute
 27. Drags forcibly
 29. Impropriety
 30. Word forms
 32. Equal to 10 meters
 34. Neither
 35. Computer language
 37. Practice of aging film or 
TV characters (abbr.)
 40. A woolen cap of Scot-

tish origin
 42. A promise
 43. Challenges
 47. Official
 49. People living in Myan-
mar
 50. Notable tower
 52. Type of sword
 53. Vaccine developer
 55. Listing
 56. Summertime insects
 57. Concluding passage
 58. Guitarist Clapton
 59. Damp and musty
 61. Central nervous system
 65. Against

Find solution to this puzzle in this issue

CROSSWORD

ACROSS DOWN

7 WEEK OLD JUVENILE 
SEXED PULLETS: YOUNG 
FEMALE CHICKENS
Off heat, ready to be out- 
side, various breeds, price 
starts at $25. Text Hens In 
The City for information, 
509‑202‑6450  Spangle

 

2 SWEET ADORABLE 
PLAYFUL KITTENS
Calicos, handled since 
birth extensively, girls & 
boys, great birthday 
presents, $15 each. Call 
509‑276‑2294 if no an- 
swer, call 509‑821‑1514 

 

YORKIE TERRIER PUP- 
PIES
Born February 25, vet 
check, deworming & vac- 
cines up to date, males 
$1200; females $1400. 
Text to 509‑666‑9794

75% MAINE COON KIT- 
TENS 
Beautiful litter, we only 
have 3 left available, they 
come with shots, de- 
wormed, litter box trained, 
socialized, both parents 
are super friendly, dad is 
21 lbs, mom is 17 lbs, these 
are indoor only kittens. 
503‑583‑5091

THE EXCHANGE HAS 
THE RIGHT
To refuse any ads if mis- 
treatment, abuse of ani- 
mals or otherwise harmful 
situations to the animals 
health or well being are 
suspected

GERMAN SHORTHAIRED 
POINTER PUPPIES 
$900 for males & $1000 
for females. If interested, 
text/ call 509‑540‑9481 

 

BEAUTIFUL AKC WEST 
HIGHLAND WHITE TER- 
RIER PUPPIES
Male puppies, dad is a AKC 
champion, $2800. 509‑ 
951‑8443 Otis Orchards

 

TICA REGISTERED BEN- 
GAL CAT 
Bengalmusiccats’ Nik is 
our gorgeous seal lynx 
young male cat, full of en- 
ergy & sweetness, Nik was 
born on December 26, 
2023, & is fully vaccinated 
& neutered. 509‑954‑ 
0519 https://BengalMusic- 
Cats.com

BEAUTIFUL MINI 
DACHSHUND FEMALE 
PUPPY 
3 sets of vaccines & sev- 
eral deworming, 10 weeks 
old, is doing very well on 
dog door, potty training & 
kennel trained, $900. 208‑ 
290‑2206 Sandpoint

 

THREE SWEET 
ADORABLE TERRI‑POO 
PUPPIES
Two boys, $400 each; one 
girl, $500. Has had all 
three puppy shots & sev- 
eral wormings, come with 
shot records, all money 
goes towards vet bill. Call 
509‑276‑2294 if no an- 
swer, call 509‑821‑1514

 

AKC BERNESE MOUN- 
TAIN DOG PUPPIES
Ready for new homes May 
25, will have age appropri- 
ate shots, dewormed & vet 
check, raised in family set- 
ting, with kids & cats, full 
rights available, males & fe- 
males available, pet price 
$900. 509‑675‑4585 Ket- 
tle Falls

 

AUSSIEDOODLES  
We have 9 beautiful 
medium sized Aussiedoo- 
dles, 20‑45 lbs estimated 
weight, ready June 17, will 
be up to date on shots & 
dewormed, $800‑ $1000. 
Call or text 509‑680‑7072

 

TOY COCKAPOO PUP- 
PIES 
One female, one male, 
ready now, will come with 
vaccines & dewormed; also 
have AKC 1 female toy 
Poodle puppy available. 
Call or text, 509‑770‑ 
5933 Moses Lake 

 

SAMOYED PUREBRED 
PUPPIES
Born March 6, 3 boys, 1 
girl, $2000 each, ready 
now. Call Randi, 509‑624‑ 
2930 Spokane

FEMALE YORKIES 
Beautiful female CKC 
Yorkshire terriers, tails 
docked, first shots, vet 
checked, serious inquiries 
only, ready now. 509‑910‑ 
6626

AKC GOLDEN RE- 
TRIEVER PUPPIES 
7 still available, ready for 
homes beginning May 28, 
first shots, dewormed & 
vet check, certified hips, 
genetic tested, family 
raised on the farm with 
kids, $1400. Call /text Dan 
at 541‑561‑2774 Ione, OR 

MICRO/ MINI BERNE- 
DOODLES 
Micro/ mini Bernedoodles 
available, $2500. Mes- 
sage/ call Burbank Berne- 
doodles, 509‑430‑7204 
Burbank

ARE YOU TIRED OF THE 
EGG PRICES?
Did you know it only costs 
$8 per month to feed 3 
chickens? 3 chickens can 
provide the minimum of 
36 eggs in a months dura- 
tion. Hens In The City 

 

PUREBRED YORKIE TER- 
RIER PUPPIES
2 girls & 3 boys need lov- 
ing homes, ready now, tails 
docked, dewclaws re- 
moved, dewormed, mom & 
dad are 5lbs., well social- 
ized, kennel trained, non‑ 
shedding & hypoaller- 
genic, parents are intelli- 
gent & both onsite. Serious 
inquiries only, please text/ 
call, 509‑720‑9180 or 509‑ 
828‑7042 Spokane Valley

 

REG. AMERICAN ES- 
KIMO PUPPIES
Toys & miniatures, males & 
females, grand champion 
bloodlines, first shots com- 
plete, $1200‑ $1500. Call 
or text, 509‑844‑6407 
Spokane

TICA MAINE COON KIT- 
TENS 
All come with shots, de- 
wormed, TICA registra- 
tion, kitten start packs, 1 
year health guarantee, 
fully socialized, spoiled, 
been raised around kids & 
other animals, fully litter 
box trained. For more in- 
formation text, 503‑583‑ 
5091 Ellensburg 

PUREBRED POMERA- 
NIAN PUPPIES 
Ready for rehoming, fe- 
males & males available. If 
interested, please reach 
out to 509‑989‑1042 Soap 
Lake
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Blanco is one of the many dogs 
available for adoption at the 
Companions Animal Center.
Come in today to meet him and 
other dogs in need of a home.
Contact one of your local 
shelters today and make a new 
friend!
• Companions Animal Center: 
 208-772-4019 or visit  
 CompanionsAnimalCenter.org
• Second Chance Animal Rescue:  
 208-267-7504 or  
 SecondChanceAnimalAdoption.com

ADOPT A SHELTER DOG!

Please Spay or Neuter Your Pets!

APPLEHEAD CHI- 
HUAHUAS! 
Excited to share a new lit- 
ter! Message for updated 
pictures & information, 
509‑591‑7089

 

ENGLISH MASTIFF/ GER- 
MAN SHEPHERD HY- 
BRID PUPPIES 
10 weeks old, 3 males, 1 fe- 
male, first shots & de- 
wormed, ready for their 
forever families, great 
guardians for home & 
property, $350. Carrie, 
707‑227‑0432 Chewelah

 

GOLDENDOODLE PUP- 
PIES 
7 weeks old, first & second 
shots & dewormed, par- 
ents both OFA & CAER, 
DNA & Orivet genetics 
tested, lots of early train- 
ing including kennel, car, 
retrieving, outdoor potty, 
exposed to sheds, duck 
hunting, love water, raised 
with farm animals & kit- 
tens, $850. Delivery avail- 
able, please text, 509‑822‑ 
9888

THE EXCHANGE HAS 
THE RIGHT
To refuse any ads if mis- 
treatment, abuse of ani- 
mals or otherwise harmful 
situations to the animals 
health or well being are 
suspected

CKC YORKSHIRE TER- 
RIER PUPPIES 
Cute Yorkie puppies, CKC 
papered, declawed, have 
all their shots, ready to go 
shortly; I also have one girl 
that is ready now. Please 
call for more information, 
509‑424‑8843

POMERANIANS 
Purebred Pomeranians 
ready for their new loving 
homes, 2 females, family 
socialized, potty trained, 
born February 26. For seri- 
ous inquiries, contact me 
at 541‑561‑8815 Hermis- 
ton, OR

GERMAN SHEPHERD/ 
BELGIAN MALINOIS 
PUPPIES
9 weeks, 2 females & 2 
males, dewormed & cur- 
rent vaccinations, $500 
each. Text only please, 
509‑690‑2904 Springdale

PUREBRED CHESA- 
PEAKE BAY RETRIEVERS 
Loyal companions & amaz- 
ing hunting partners, 2 
males & 3 females, $1000. 
Call 509‑596‑6379 
Prosser

 

AKBASH/ PYRENEES 
PUPPIES
Livestock guardian dogs, 
predator control without 
training, shots & de- 
wormed, willing to meet in- 
terested party, $300 or 
best offer/ barter. Calls 
only 509‑779‑4445 
Curlew, WA 

 

AKC REG. PUG PUPPIES
Fawn colored males & one 
lovely black male. Excep- 
tional quality dogs, PDE 
negative, first shots & 
wormed, socialized & 
friendly, lovely puppies, 
$2000. Call & leave mes- 
sage, 509‑276‑7968 or 
call/ text, 509‑821‑2942 
North of Spokane

 

MINIATURE AUS- 
TRALIAN SHEPHERD 
PUPPIES
One male, one female, tri 
color, will have vaccines & 
dewormed, parents onsite, 
$800. 509‑842‑7226 
Spokane Valley 

AKC PUREBRED REGIS- 
TERED YELLOW LAB 
PUPPIES 
To be rehomed, 1 male, 1 
female, born April 1. Call 
509‑385‑9827 Deer Park

ATTENTION FEMALE 
VETERANS
Operation Dog Tag is start- 
ing dog training classes for 
female MST survivors. 
These classes are free & 
held at the Spokane Vet 
Center on Mirabeau Park- 
way in Spokane Valley. For 
details please contact Joe, 
509‑276‑4364 be sure to 
leave a message & I will get 
back to you. Thank you for 
your service

 

PRECIOUS PUG PUPPIES
Absolutely adorable & 
sweet purebred Pug ba- 
bies will be ready for their 
new homes on May 12, 3 
males, 3 females, 5 black & 
1 fawn, well socialized & 
excellent temperaments, 
taking deposits now to 
hold, $850 each. Please 
call or text for more infor- 
mation, 509‑671‑7307 
Chewelah

 

PUREBRED YORKSHIRE 
TERRIERS
Sweet temperaments, very 
playful, first shots, de- 
wormed, boys & girls avail- 
able, will be ready by June 
1, boy $1200, girls $1500. 
For serious inquiries, text 
509‑699‑8546

 

AIREDALE TERRIER PUP- 
PIES
AKC, quality lines, gentle, 
sweet temperaments, 
good with children & live- 
stock, great companions 
for seniors, very calm & hy- 
poallergenic, males & fe- 
males, first shots & de- 
wormed. Call now! 719‑ 
217‑8054

 

CORSO/ AMERICAN 
STAFFORDSHIRE PUP- 
PIES
9 adorable puppies are 
looking for their potential 
person or family to love 
forever, I own both par- 
ents & they are amazing, 
both of them are always 
ready to go hiking, camp- 
ing, walk with me or just 
watch Netflix, they are 
both loved members of 
our family & these babies 
are a perfect blend of their 
sire & dam, they will be 
ready in two weeks, born 
April 3, they will be de- 
wormed, have first shots, 
$650‑ $700. Please text 
my number for more infor- 
mation if you have any 
questions, 208‑702‑2915 
Kamiah

 

STANDARD GOLDEN- 
DOODLE PUPPIES 
Born March 18, $1500. 
208‑308‑6620 Lewiston

MINI HEELER PUPPIES 
Miniature Australian Cat- 
tle Dog puppies, genetic 
health tested, vaccinated, 
dewormed, microchipped 
& care package. 509‑945‑ 
5108

FEMALE POCKET BULLY 
ABR certified 1 year old in- 
tact female Pocket Bully, 
house trained, crate 
trained, leash trained, 
$2000. 509‑614‑8086

 

PUREBRED MALTESE
Are you lonely? Take home 
one of my irresistible pure- 
bred Maltese and you’ll 
have a best friend for 
many years, my buyers tell 
me that their Maltese are 
the heart of their home & 
shower them with uncon- 
ditional love & acceptance. 
Check out www.Spokane- 
MaltesePuppies.com or 
contact me at SpokaneMal- 
tesePuppies@gmail.com

AKC BEAGLE PUPPIES 
10 weeks old & ready to go 
now! Call or text for more 
information, 541‑720‑ 
1098

WEEKLY
Horoscopes

for May 15 - 21

ARIES – Mar 21/Apr 20
Aries, this week you may feel a desire to 

take charge of your professional life. Trust 
your instincts, but remember that you may 
have to go out of your comfort zone at some 
point.

TAURUS – Apr 21/May 21
Introspection is paramount right now, 

Taurus. You may find yourself reflecting on 
your values, goals and personal growth. This 
week there are chances to change.

GEMINI – May 22/Jun 21
Gemini, right now is a good time to 

collaborate with others, whether at work or in 
personal projects. Use any time this week to 
your advantage to attend social events.

CANCER – Jun 22/Jul 22 
Put your long-term goals in focus this 

week, Cancer. Start thinking about where you 
would like your career to go. You’ll certainly 
feel driven to make progress. 

LEO – Jul 23/Aug 23
Adventure is the name of the game for 

you right now, Leo. Whether it is travel, high-
er learning or other new experiences, you just 
may soon break free of your routine.

VIRGO – Aug 24/Sept 22
This is a week when practicality and 

organization will be your friends, Virgo. You 
will likely feel a need to get things in order. If 
you have any outstanding debts, tackle them 
now.

LIBRA – Sept 23/Oct 23
Libra, the spotlight is on you for the time 

being. You are feeling more confident and 
ready to take charge of your destiny. Personal 
growth may come by way of a job promotion.

SCORPIO – Oct 24/Nov 22
Scorpio, you may be drawn to more qui-

et, intimate moments with your partner this 
week. This is a great time for reflection and 
connection for the both of you.

SAGITTARIUS – Nov 23/Dec 21
Sagittarius, expect to meet new people 

or form bonds with others who share similar 
interests and goals this week. Communi-
ty-based projects may draw your attention.  

CAPRICORN – Dec 22/Jan 20
This week the focus will be on your 

career, Capricorn. You’ll feel more motivated 
than ever to achieve your goals, but it will 
take a lot of hard work to get there.

AQUARIUS – Jan 21/Feb 18
Aquarius, you might feel more connected 

to your spiritual side right now and want to 
seek knowledge or inspiration in areas like 
philosophy. Take every opportunity to learn 
and grow.

PISCES – Feb 19/Mar 20
Pisces, now is a good time to focus 

on your financial situation and make some 
changes for your security and personal 
growth. Your intuition will guide you.
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WORD SCRAMBLE
Rearrange the letters to spell something  

pertaining to Photos

Answer: LENS

 
THERAPY DOGS

www.TherapyDogs.com

Is Looking for Therapy Dogs 
in This Area!
IS YOUR DOG 
• Friendly & Sociable?
• Bring Joy to Both Young & Old People?

There is a huge need in this area for Therapy 
Dogs to visit medical facilities, retirement 
homes, hospice care, etc.
It’s a great way to spend time with your dog  
& give back to your community. Your dog  
does NOT NEED to have ANY Special  
Obedience Training, or Therapy Dog Training. 

WE TEST YOU & YOUR DOG AT NO CHARGE!

Alliance of 
THERAPY DOGS

Please visit our webpage for information, and to apply

APPLEHEAD CHI- 
HUAHUAS! 
Excited to share a new lit- 
ter! Message for updated 
pictures & information, 
509‑591‑7089

CKC YORKSHIRE TER- 
RIER PUPPIES 
Cute Yorkie puppies, CKC 
papered, declawed, have 
all their shots, ready to go 
shortly; I also have one girl 
that is ready now. Please 
call for more information, 
509‑424‑8843

 

PYRENEES/ POODLE 
CROSS
Two left, both female, one 
black & one blond, has had 
all deworming & 2 sets of 
shots, $350 each. 509‑209‑ 
1464 Spokane

 

SHETLAND SHEEPDOGS 
PUPPIES
2 Sheltie puppies left, ex- 
cellent family dogs, 13 
weeks old,  $750. Please 
call or text, 509‑844‑3702 
Newman Lake

 

WOLF HYBRID CUBS
High content 90‑ 95%+, 
grey phase & one black 
phase cub available, bottle 
raised & social, ready now, 
$1000 each. Call or text 
509‑437‑0828

 

CAIRN TERRIER YORKIE 
MIX PUPPIES
Looking for their forever 
homes, 10 weeks, 1 male & 
2 females, hypoallergenic, 
non‑shedding, shots & de- 
wormed, super friendly & 
well socialized, $500. Call/ 
text, 509‑822‑8500 
Springdale

 

PUREBRED RAT TERRI- 
ERS MALE & FEMALE
Well trained, super smart, 
best behaved, no barking, 
lap dogs, can go anywhere 
with you, potential service 
animals, 4 months old,  
$900 each or $1450 to- 
gether. Call Greg, 509‑ 
440‑7731 North Spokane 
near Northtown Mall

COCKER SPANIEL PUP- 
PIES 
Available now, purebred, 
dewormed, weaned, $950 
or best offer. Please call/ 
text 509‑579‑6051 Pasco

 

BLACK STANDARD F1BB 
GOLDENDOODLE PUP- 
PIES 
5 months old May 12, 3 
girls, 1 boy, $300 or best 
offer, delivery options 
available. 832‑445‑6016 
Tonasket

HUSKIES 
16 weeks old, 2 shots, de- 
wormed, 2 males & 4 fe- 
males. Text for informa- 
tion 509‑518‑2133 

 

F1B MINI COCKAPOOS
Up to date on vaccinations 
& deworming, pre‑spoiled, 
delivery options available. 
For more information & 
photos, please call 208‑ 
935‑5919 Kooskia 

AKC YELLOW LABS 
These are well bred pup- 
pies, strong foundation of 
master hunters & AKC 
champions! Please text or 
call 509‑528‑3544MALTIPOO & SHIH TZU 

PUPPIES 
Gorgeous Maltipoos, fe- 
males & males available, 
they have their vaccines 
up to date, have been de- 
wormed & are potty train- 
ing on pads, great with 
kids, seniors & other ani- 
mals, I have one Teacup 
that will be under 4 lbs & 
the rest will be under 8 lbs, 
they are very loving pup- 
pies, love kisses & cuddles, 
hypoallergenic & don’t 
shed. If you have any more 
questions, please call or 
text me at 509‑539‑7715 

 

FULL AKC REGISTERED 
GERMAN SHEPHERD 
PUPPIES
1 boy, 2 girls, current im- 
munization, dewormed, so- 
cialized with kids & other 
pets, both parents are on- 
site, more information on 
AKC marketplace site, 
$1200. Cell 509‑863‑ 
1804 Spokane

AUGI PUPPIES
Corgi/ Australian Shep- 
herd mix, two available, tri 
colored, with tails, $900. 
509‑431‑1384 Moses 
Lake 

CHIWEENIES 
I am picking up more work 
& I have less time with my 
babies, they weigh be- 
tween 12‑ 15 lbs, they 
need to be together or else 
they will cry for one an- 
other, they are not 
spayed/ neutered, they are 
potty trained outside, they 
do well loose around the 
home, asking $300 for 
both. For more informa- 
tion, contact Vivianna at 
509‑975‑4111 

MINI SPRINGERDOODLE 
PUPPY 
We have one male Mini 
Springerdoodle left, born 
March 4, up to date on 
shots & dewormed, hypoal- 
lergenic, socialized & 
ready for his forever 
home, $200 nonrefund- 
able deposit that will 
count towards total cost of 
$800. Please call or text at 
509‑301‑3855 Yakima 
area

AKC BICHON FRISE PUP- 
PIES 
Ready now, male & female 
available. 509‑270‑2905

 

BIEWER TERRIER PUP- 
PIES
Born January 30, AKC reg- 
istered, vet check, de- 
worming & vaccines up to 
date, males $1200; fe- 
males $1350. Text 509‑ 
666‑9794

MINI DACHSHUND PUP- 
PIES 
Parents onsite. Call/ text 
509‑948‑4970 Kennewick

JACK RUSSELL TERRIER 
“SHORTIES” 
2 males & 1 female 
EJRTCA Jack Russell Ter- 
rier puppies, 7 weeks old, 
dewclaws clipped, tails 
docked, vaccinated & de- 
wormed, ready for loving 
homes, $1200. Call or text 
509‑895‑4538 

 

MINI SCHNOODLE PUP- 
PIES
Vaccines, wormings with 
records, ready May 24. 
Soft, curly, wavy, non‑shed- 
ding coats with multiple 
colors & patterns. Schnoo- 
dles starting at $500. Call 
509‑722‑4721, Text 509‑ 
936‑4184

 

AKC COLLIE FEMALE 
PUPPIES
Born March 11, parents 
onsite, first shots, $1200. 
Call 509‑319‑6164

AKC LABRADOR RE- 
TRIEVERS 
Some bloodlines are grand 
champion Dickendale, 
grand champion Bella 
Mare, grand champion sil- 
ver/ champion Shalimar’s, 
champion Zinfndel, Ri- 
oRocks, Sandamar, cham- 
pion Hofmans, Tiger Moun- 
tain & many other lines we 
carefully matched to pro- 
duce great conformation 
hunting dogs, they have 
thick bones, squared head 
pieces, nice top lines, great 
angulation, intelligence, 
great temperament, drive 
& great sound pedigrees, 
12 weeks old. 509‑985‑ 
7438

AKC FRENCH BULLDOG 
PUPPY 
This little boy is going to 
be a show stopper, if 
you’re looking to up your 
game or just clean house at 
a BRC dog show, here’s 
your chance, he’s every- 
thing in a small package, 
comes with health guaran- 
tee, shots, dewormed, 
puppy pack, AKC papers, 
lifetime breeder support, 
parents are fully health 
tested. For more informa- 
tion text 503‑583‑5091 or 
www.OceanBlueBullies- 
LLC.com

ADORABLE POMSKY 
PUPPY! 
This tiny cuddly Pomsky 
puppy is looking for his for- 
ever home, mom is a beau- 
tiful 50/50 Pomsky with a 
great Husky coat, dad is a 
fun 25/75, 25% Husky & is 
a red/ white Pomsky with 
fantastic markings, this fur 
baby looks like he’s gonna 
have good ones too, vet 
checked, up to date on vac- 
cines & dewormed. Text is 
best or call 458‑300‑8499

 

TRIPLE DOODLE PUP- 
PIES!
Ready for their new homes 
now, puppies were de- 
wormed at 3, 5 & 7 weeks, 
had ENS training days 3‑ 
16 of life, their first vac- 
cines, vet check with a 
clean bill of health, so 
much love & socialization 
from our family, mom is a 
Double Doodle (Mini 
Bernedoodle x Goldendoo- 
dle) & dad is a Labradoo- 
dle, this ensures these pup- 
pies have great hybrid 
vigor & will be extremely 
healthy dogs, both parents 
are Embark genetic tested 
& have a clean bill of 
health, these puppies 
could easily become 
trained as service dogs, 
mom is 45lbs & dad is 
65lbs, puppies should 
grow to be roughly 55 lbs 
full grown, $1000 for 
Henry, the brown boy as 
well as for Aggie, the little 
girl; $800 for Milo, Booch 
& Rover. You can see more 
pictures & information on 
Instagram @covesdoodles, 
435‑764‑0123 Coeur d’A- 
lene

 

SHIH TZU PUPPIES
First shots & dewormed, 
parents onsite, loved & 
handled, $650. Call 509‑ 
640‑1765 Colville 

PUG PUPPY 
8 weeks old, black, female. 
If interested about rehom- 
ing fee, contact 509‑728‑ 
3246 

 

MALTIPOO PUPPIES
Two males, ready for new 
homes, socialized with cats 
& children, fully up to date 
on vaccinations & deworm- 
ing, vet checked, non shed- 
ding, 10 lbs., fully grown, 
$1000. Call/ text, 509‑ 
230‑8710 Mead
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509-738-2985

GET MORE  
DO MORE!

Your Local Dealer

JJRiggsEquipment.com • 685 Elm Tree Dr. Colville

0% Financing on Select Models

OUR CUSTOMERS 
GIVE US 5 STARS

WEDNESDAY 
5th Street Farmers’ Market
Sherman Ave & Fifth St., Coeur d’Alene
4pm-7pm, May 14 - September 24

The Farmers Market at Sandpoint
Farmin Park, 3rd & Main St, Sandpoint
3-5:30pm, May 3 - October 18

Kootenai County Farmers’ Market
Main Street, Riverstone, CDA
4-7pm, May - September

FRIDAY 
Athol Farmers’ Market
Athol City Park, 30230 Second Street
2-6pm, May 2 - September 26

St. Maries Farmers’ Market
Mullan Trail Park
3-6:30pm, June - September

SATURDAY 
Silver Valley Community Market
2 N Hill St., Kellogg
9-1pm, June 19 - August 21

Bonners Ferry Farmers’ Market
Corner of Kootenai & Hwy 95, Bonners Ferry
8am-1pm, April 26 - October 4

Kootenai County Farmers’ Market
SE Corner Hwy 95 & Prairie Ave, Hayden
9am-1:30pm, May - October 

Rathdrum Craft and Farmers Market
Rathdrum Lions Club, 16114 N Meyer Rd
9am-2pm, May 3 - September 27

Pend Oreille Valley Farmers Market
236 S. Union Ave., Newport
9am-1pm, May 3 - October 25

The Farmers Market at Sandpoint
Farmin Park, 3rd & Main St, Sandpoint
9am-1pm, May 3 - October 18

FARMER'S MARKET 
SCHEDULE

Meeting Your Lubrication needs at Fair Prices & exceLLent service since 1983
N. 8321 Market, Spokane • (509) 467-3130 • 800-791-2149 • www.PacificPetro.net

We FiLL Your 
container —
5 GalloN to 
55 GalloN

Bulk Oil
Many Grades

CaLL 
nOW!

ANOTHER SUCCESS STORY!

“Our Readers Are Your Buyers”

I get all my business from  
the Exchange!
-  BT Lawn Care ”“

 

1999 KENWORTH 
W900L HEAVY HAUL
Factory Cat 1MM 15.8L 
3406E 600hp, RT- 
LO20918B, 25k list axle, 
46k rears on Neway, clean 
Southern truck with zero 
rust, $85,000.  www.Great- 
NorthernEquip.com  Call 
509‑535‑4427 Spokane

AUCTION NORTHWEST 
IS THE PLACE TO SELL 
YOUR USED EQUIPMENT
Consign for our next on- 
line equipment auction. 
Wondering what we will 
consign? Just give us a call 
at 208‑994‑6003. Located 
at 3156 N. Beck Road, 
Post Falls, we want to 
make your selling & buying 
experience a positive one. 
Check on upcoming auc- 
tions at www.Auction- 
NorthwestLLC.HiBid.com

 

FORKLIFT SALES, 
RENTALS, PARTS & SER- 
VICE
2023 Ekko EK25LP Fork- 
lift, Kubota propane en- 
gine, 5000lb lift, 3 stage 
mast, side shift, solid pneu- 
matic tires. Mention this 
ad, sale price of $28,500 
plus free PM service! 
Share your 5 Star experi- 
ence on Google or Face- 
book for a chance to win 
one of five $20 gift cards 
to North 40 or a Grand 
Prize of 4 Spokane Chiefs 
tickets & a $50 North 40 
gift card. 509‑868‑5962  
www.SpokaneForklift.com

 

2001 TRAIL KING TK12U 
12K TILT TRAILER
16’ full tilt, new tires, ex 
government trailer that 
was never used, $8,000.  
www.GreatNorth- 
ernEquip.com  509‑535‑ 
4427 Spokane

 

ENHANCE YOUR LAND- 
SCAPE WITH A BEAUTI- 
FUL BRIDGE
Make your garden an 
earthly delight! Composite 
materials, zinc plated fas- 
teners & DIY kits available. 
We also have waterwheels 
that are easy to set up & 
plug in (aerates water for 
fish health!). Plus we can 
install above ground 
ponds! Call Jab Dynamics 
509‑844‑8891 or email 
jaberggren@hotmail.com

 

AUCTION NORTHWEST 
ONLINE AUCTION! 
STARTS MAY 30
Accepting consignment of 
equipment, vehicles, tools, 
ATV’s, building supplies, 
trailers & more. Unsure if 
we will consign some- 
thing? Just give us a call! 
We strive to provide a 
great experience & trusted 
service to both consignors 
& buyers with our Online 
Equipment Auctions. We 
also do online auctions for 
business & estate liquida- 
tions. We are located at 
3156 N. Beck Road, Post 
Falls, ID. Open Tuesday 
through Friday, 8am‑4pm. 
Contact info@auction‑nw.- 
com or call 208‑994‑6003. 
To register: www.Auction- 
NorthwestLLC.HiBid.com 

TRACKMAN PARTS & 
SERVICE IN SPOKANE
Your best source for skid 
steer, crawler, tractor & ex- 
cavator parts & undercar- 
riages. Rollers, sprockets, 
cutting edges, rubber 
tracks, shoes, idlers, 
grouser steel, points, 
tracks, skidder chains. Ser- 
vice, buy, sell, trade. Same 
day service available. 713 
N Cook, Spokane, 509‑ 
535‑1661 www.Trackman- 
PartsAndService.com

EQUIPMENT AUCTIONS 
BY J. STOUT AUCTIONS
Watch for more informa- 
tion on our upcoming 
sales, May 28 & 29 and 
June 25 & 26. To see a 
complete listing of the 
equipment in these sales, 
& an online catalog go to 
www.JStoutAuction.com 
or call 1‑888‑230‑8840

 

2007 PETERBILT 367
738,457 miles, Cummins 
ISX DOHC 15L 600hp, 18 
speed transmission, dou- 
ble differential Locks, 
40,000lb rears on AirTrac, 
63,370lb GVW air ride 
cab, 36” sleeper, lift axle, 
270” wheelbase, PTO, 
Palfinger 12K folding 
crane, 4 section boom, 
cordless remote control, 
21’x6”x96” bed, pintle 
hitch, $28,500. More pic- 
tures at www.GreatNorth- 
ernEquip.com Calls only, 
509‑535‑4427 Spokane

 

2006 OTTAWA HOSTLER 
SPOTTER TRUCK
Commando 30, Cummins 
6BT 5.9L 12 valve mechan- 
ical engine, Allison trans- 
mission, $17,500. More 
pictures at www.Great- 
NorthernEquip.com Calls 
only, 509‑535‑4427 
Spokane 

 

2005 KOMATSU 
PC160LC‑7 EXCAVATOR
Pre emission Cummins 
4BTA 3.9, new 36” dig 
bucket, Link Thumb, 60” 
cleanup bucket, wedge 
coupler, 80% undercar- 
riage, AC, 7100 hours, ex- 
cellent condition, $75,000. 
More pictures at www.- 
GreatNorthernEquip.com 
or call 509‑535‑4427 
Spokane

PREPARE FOR POWER 
OUTAGES TODAY
With a Generac Home 
Standby Generator, act 
now to receive a free 5 
year warranty with qualify- 
ing purchase, call 1‑855‑ 
948‑6176 today to sched- 
ule a free quote. It’s not 
just a generator, it’s a 
power move

 

2019 CAT 336 EXCAVA- 
TOR
Link thumb, heat & AC, 52” 
dig bucket, 4500 hours, 
$190,000. www.Great- 
NorthernEquip.com  Call 
509‑535‑4427 Spokane

SPRING YARD CLEANUP 
& HAULING
Is your yard a mess? We 
can clean it up & make it 
beautiful again this Spring. 
Junk hauling, yard debris, 
raking, tree services too! 
Lic. #ROBBIGR889MR. 
Serving Eastern Washing- 
ton & North Idaho areas. 
Call or text, 208‑304‑3503

DAVE’S TRUCK & EQUIP- 
MENT IN SAGLE
We buy & consign equip- 
ment & trucks, and work 
on heavy equipment & 
farm tractors. Call for your 
quote on undercarriage 
parts. In business over 30 
years. 208‑263‑3555 Sagle
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509-869-0976 • CordisDesignsLLC@gmail.com

Custom Design Drawings, Calculations, 
Permit Support & Quick Turnaround!

Cordis Designs, LLC. 

WE DESIGN BUILDINGS 
SHOPS • GARAGES • BARNS • BARNDOMINIUMS
RESIDENCES • WAREHOUSES • AIRCRAFT HANGARS

RESIDENTIAL 
& COMMERCIAL

fluidroofing.net
509-244-1001

Roofing Solutions

Whatever your 
roofing needs we’ve got 
you covered! Call or visit our 
website to schedule a FREE QUOTE. 

We’ve Got You Covered!

Free 
Quotes!

Receive a free 5-year warranty 
with qualifying purchase*  
- valued at $535.

Be prepared before the next power outage.

Call 866-643-0438 to 
schedule your free quote!

 

HAVE YOU CLEANED 
YOUR BLINDS LATELY?
Combine equal parts wa- 
ter & vinegar in a bowl. 
Then get a sock & put it 
over your hand. Dip the 
sock in the solution and 
run over each slate to re- 
move dirt & dust! This 
Make Your Life Better 
Hack brought to you by 
the Exchange

 

2017 LINK‑BELT 210LX 
LOG LOADER
38’ boom, 52” grapple, 
8000 hours, nice machine, 
$115,000. More pictures 
at www.GreatNorth- 
ernEquip.com or call 509‑ 
535‑4427 Spokane

 

2019 JOHN DEERE 
2154G PROCESSOR
Waratah 622C 4x4 head, 
4200 hours, $230,000. 
More pictures at www.- 
GreatNorthernEquip.com  
Call 509‑535‑4427 
Spokane

CAST IRON IMPLEMENT 
SEATS WANTED
Also known as tractor 
seats. No reproductions, 
no stamped metal unless 
they have a name im- 
pressed in them. Prices 
based upon condition & 
style. Call or text, 509‑ 
539‑3161 or 
FloSayre1948@gmail.com

 

2022 BIGTEX FULL TILT 
TRAILER
14K trailer, new 14 ply 
tires, 18’ full tilt trailer, 
$10,500. www.Great- 
NorthernEquip.com  Call 
509‑535‑4427 Spokane

NEED TO SELL YOUR 
FARM EQUIPMENT?
Call Booker Auction Com- 
pany, we are an Auction 
Service that goes beyond 
buy & sell! See our web- 
site, www.BookerAuction.- 
com for more details on up- 
coming Auctions. Call 
Austin for details, 509‑ 
989‑1062 Eltopia

PANHANDLE MOBILE 
WELDING
Certified portable & in‑ 
shop welding & fabrication, 
gates, staircases, construc- 
tion, structural, repairs, 
tiny home frames. Lic#’s: 
PANHAMW793PK & RCE‑ 
59926. Serving Eastern 
WA & North ID. Free esti- 
mates, 208‑217‑7687

TOOLS & EQUIPMENT 
THIS FRIDAY AT PRE- 
MIER AUCTION
High end Lincoln & Miller 
welders, rods, torches, 
grinders, air compressors, 
saws, milling tools, a join- 
ter, much more! Friday, 
May 16, doors open at 
3pm Friday for previewing, 
& bidding starts at 4:- 
30pm. 674 N. Pleasant 
View in Post Falls. Please 
visit our website for more 
information & pictures! 
www.PremierAuctionCen- 
ter.com

BATH & SHOWER UP- 
DATES
In as little as one day! Af- 
fordable prices. No pay- 
ments for 18 months! Life- 
time warranty & profes- 
sional installs. Senior & mil- 
itary discounts available. 
Call 1‑877‑543‑9189 

NORTHWEST STEEL
Local manufacturer & sup- 
plier, quick turnaround! 
Metal roofing, siding, & 
custom trim. Featuring: 
16” SnapLock Standing 
Seam Premium Concealed 
Fastener Roof Panels. Ag 
& PBR Panels:  Premium 
domestic steel.  Serving 
Eastern WA & North ID, 
limited 40‑year warranty. 
Located at 330741 High- 
way 2, Newport, WA.  
www.NorthwestSteelCo.- 
com 509‑671‑3782

 

2009 12’x7’ CARGO 
TRAILER
Double axle, 7000 GVWR, 
side door, D rings installed, 
like new, $4900 or best of- 
fer. 208‑310‑0636 
Moscow

2018 CAT 305 E2 EXCA- 
VATOR
Two buckets, hydraulic pin 
grabber, 4 way hydraulic 
blade, only 3100 hours, en- 
closed cab, beautiful & 
ready for your Spring jobs, 
$55,000. Dave’s Truck & 
Equipment, 208‑263‑ 
3555 Sagle

IT’S SPRING! TIME TO 
BUILD! WE ARE 
SCHEDULING JOBS
Now! Pole barns, shops, 
barndominiums, shouses, 
barns or any type of build- 
ing you would like! Lic. 
#SIMSCCL780KC. We are 
Sims Construction, call or 
text, 509‑869‑7790 or 
509‑703‑3717. Deal di- 
rectly with the owner!

 

PROFESSIONAL 
PAINTERS SAY...
Paint the trim first then 
ceilings & last the walls. It’s 
easier to tape off the trim 
versus taping off both the 
trim & walls. This Make 
Your Life Better Hack 
brought to you by the Ex- 
change

 

PORTABLE SAW 
MILLING, MOBILE SAW 
MILL
Rough cut lumber & band- 
saw blade sharpening, we 
can also custom mill your 
logs for your next project. 
Liberty Saw Works, Matt 
Harvey, 509‑939‑2355 
Creston

ASPHALT SEAL COAT- 
ING USING GSB‑78 
SEALER
Not a paint or water based 
product. Long lanes, park- 
ing lots, driveways, no job 
too big or too small. Free 
estimates, serving the In- 
land Northwest. Gorman 
Coatings, 35 years experi- 
ence, Lic. #JAMES- 
G*810MP. James, 509‑ 
496‑5099

WATER DAMAGE 
CLEAN UP
A small amount of water 
can lead to major damage 
to your home. Our trusted 
professionals dry out wet 
areas & repair to protect 
your family & your home 
value! Call 24/7 1‑833‑ 
887‑0117 Have zip code!

REPLACE YOUR ROOF 
With the best looking & 
longest lasting material 
steel from Erie Metal 
Roofs! 3 styles & multiple 
colors available. Guaran- 
teed to last a lifetime! Lim- 
ited time offer up to 50% 
off install & additional 10% 
off for military, health & 
first responders. 1‑833‑ 
370‑1234

POLE BUILDINGS ARE 
OUR SPECIALTY!
Call now to schedule your 
building, we can build all 
sizes & designs! Deal di- 
rectly with the owner, not 
a salesman! Frame Rite 
Structures, www.- 
FrameRiteStructures.com   
Since 1997. Call or text 
Tony, 509‑981‑6033
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From Plantly.io

Vegetables & 
Herbs:
Kale, Lettuce, Radishes, 
Spinach & Winter greens
Ornamentals:
Baptisia, Black-eyed 
Susan, Campanula,  
Cinquefoil & Russian Sage
Shrubs & Trees:
Harrow Delight pear, Honeycrisp apple, 
Native pawpaw trees, Pink Lady apple, Snow 
Beauty peach, Superior plum &  Warren pear

Best Plants to Grow 
in Zone 5

Northern portions of Ferry, Stephens, Pend 
Oreille, Bonner & Boundary Counties( )

Call today and receive a 

FREE SHOWER PACKAGE
PLUS $1600 OFF

With purchase of a new Safe Step Walk-In Tub. Not applicable with any previous 
walk-in tub purchase. Offer available while supplies last. No cash value. Must present 

offer at time of purchase. CSLB 1082165  NSCB 0082999  0083445

With purchase of a new Safe Step Walk-In Tub. Not applicable with any previous 

1-855-417-13061-855-417-1306

Call today and receive a 

FREE SHOWER PACKAGE
1600 OFF

SPECIAL OFFER

Before

After

New orders only. Does not include material costs. Cannot be combined with any other offer. Minimum purchase required. Other restrictions 
may apply. This is an advertisement placed on behalf of Erie Construction Mid-West, Inc (“Erie”). Offer terms and conditions may apply and 
the offer may not available in your area. If you call the number provided, you consent to being contacted by telephone, SMS text message, 
email, pre-recorded messages by Erie or its affi liates and service providers using automated technologies notwithstanding if you are on a 
DO NOT CALL list or register. Please review our Privacy Policy and Terms of Use on homeservicescompliance.com. All rights reserved. License 
numbers available at eriehome.com/erie-licenses/

1.833.370.1234
FREE ESTIMATE

LIMITED  
TIME 

OFFER!
SAVE!

UP TO

50%
INSTALLATION

OFF

Expires 4/30/2025 MADE IN THE U.S.A.

Make the smart and ONLY CHOICE  when tackling your roof!

We Carry Only the Best!

18804 E. Broadway Rd. Spokane Valley • WilderAffordableHomesSpokane.com • 509-822-1850

You Can Count On Us! We Make Dreams Come True!

TURNKEY INVESTMENT
VACATION RENTALS

509-822-1850
wilderaffordablehomes.com

18805 E. Broadway Rd. Spokane Valley, WA 99016

WE MAKE DREAMS COME TRUE

TURNKEY INVESTMENT
VACATION RENTALS

509-822-1850
wilderaffordablehomes.com

18805 E. Broadway Rd. Spokane Valley, WA 99016

WE MAKE DREAMS COME TRUE

"Mt. Spokane"Come Tour the 
4 Bed, 2 Bath

The Attention to Detail & the "Extras" will AMAZE You!

Extra Sink & 
Ample Cabinets 

in a Large 
Laundry Room

10x12 Walk 
in Closet with 

Built-ins!

Deluxe Marble  
Master Bath with 

Double Sinks, 
Huge Shower & 

Soaker Tub

Stunning 10 Acre Retreat - 
Mountain Views in Rathdrum  
3 Beds, 2.5 baths, 1891 sq.ft., Property can be Split

SCHNEIDMILLER
REALTY

JOE DOBSON
208-661-0650

$899,900
Own a Piece of Idaho, Before it’s Gone

MARLETTE HOMES, 
GOLDEN WEST HOMES, 
CLAYTON HOMES,
Fleetwood Homes & Palm 
Harbor Homes with online 
pricing including delivery 
& set up. The Home Boys, 
3335 Travel Plaza Way, 
Pasco, WA 99301, 509‑ 
416‑2840 or The Home 
Boys, 15906 E Sprague, 
Spokane Valley, WA, 
99037, 509‑481‑9830, or 
online: www.TheHome- 
Boys.com Open 7 days a 
week 9am‑5pm

 

FULL MANUFACTURED 
HOME SERVICES
Transport, take down, set 
up, level, anchor, finish 
work, skirting. Certified & 
licensed full mobile home 
service for Eastern WA/ 
North ID. Onsite demoli- 
tion/ removal service avail- 
able. Licensed transport 
available. Excellent reputa- 
tion, references available. 
Lic#: ONECACH789DC. 
Free consultations & esti- 
mates. We also buy manu- 
factured homes! Contact 
us today! 1 Call Home Ser- 
vices, 509‑979‑4575

LOOKING FOR A CABIN 
TO PUT ON YOUR LAND?
Easy to assemble log cabin 
kit. Liquidation price, 
$80% off! Was $93,570, 
now $18,800! Pre‑cut log 
walls, timber rafters, ridge 
beams, gable cover, porch 
set, includes all plans! Can 
haul, pay when delivered. 
For detailed information, 
please call 214‑771‑6887

AGING ROOF? NEW 
HOMEOWNER? GOT 
STORM DAMAGE?
You need a local expert 
provider that proudly 
stands behind their work. 
Fast, free estimate. Financ- 
ing available. Have zip 
code of property ready 
when calling! Call 1‑888‑ 
878‑9091

POLE BUILDINGS ARE 
OUR SPECIALTY!
Call now to schedule your 
building, we can build all 
sizes & designs! Deal di- 
rectly with the owner, not 
a salesman! Frame Rite 
Structures, www.- 
FrameRiteStructures.com   
Since 1997. Call or text 
Tony, 509‑981‑6033

MOTORHOME, FIFTH 
WHEEL, TRAVEL 
TRAILER SERVICE &
Repair. RV Service Techni- 
cian with 30+ years experi- 
ence. We can come to you! 
Fast, professional service 
on all makes & models, rea- 
sonable rates. We also 
move & relocate RVs of all 
types. Call or text, 208‑ 
783‑5229 Post Falls

I CAN HELP YOU DESIGN 
YOUR DROP SHOP OR 
BUILDING!
Make it a reality this year! 
Call Cordis Designs! We 
design shops, garages, 
barns, & barndominiums, 
residences, warehouses, 
aircraft hangars & more! 
Design drawings, calcula- 
tions, permit support & 
quick turnaround. Email us 
at CordisDesignsLLC@g- 
mail.com 509‑869‑0976  
for additional information

 

DO YOU NEED A SHOP? 
NEED A WAREHOUSE? 
NEED MORE STORAGE?
Call the Northwest’s 
Largest Pole Building Con- 
tractor, Steel Structures 
America, 1‑888‑598‑8166 
or visit www.SteelStruc- 
turesAmerica.com

 

PEACEFUL, PRIME LOCA- 
TION LIVING
This move‑in‑ready 1996 
Marlette in Fruitland 
Park—one of Coeur d’- 
Alene’s most clean, tidy & 
affordable 55+ communi- 
ties—offers unbeatable 
convenience just behind 
Fred Meyer & minutes 
from Costco, Home Depot 
& top medical care. Enjoy a 
2020 roof, lush organic 
garden beds & vibrant sea- 
sonal blooms. Lot rent is 
just $500/ month, includ- 
ing water, sewer, garbage 
& snow removal. Park ap- 
proval required. Open 
House, Sunday, May 18, 
1pm‑3pm. 576 W Myriah 
Loop, Coeur d’Alene. 
Listed by Lisa Ciraulo at 
NextHome 365 Realty. 
Call Erik Linder at Nex- 
tHome 365 Realty for 
more information, 208‑ 
610‑7776

LIVESTOCK & WILDLIFE 
FENCING EXPERTS
All Terrain Fence can help 
you with all your fencing 
needs. Deer, elk, equine & 
field fencing. StayTuff in- 
staller. Excavator available 
for ground management, 
water lines & automatic 
livestock watering sys- 
tems. Shawn, 509‑998‑ 
9570. www.AllTerrain- 
Fence.com  Lic.# ALLTET- 
F903JA

GARAGES, SHOPS, POLE 
BARNS, HAY COVERS, 
BARNDOMINIUMS 
We build all sizes! Your 
project is our work of art! 
Work directly with the 
owners, guaranteed! Call 
now to schedule your 
building! Also excavation 
& dirt work. 20+ years ex- 
perience, Extreme Con- 
struction, Lic. # EX- 
TREC*76‑39N. Call or 
text, 509‑230‑5304

 

EXPERIENCE LUXURY 
LIVING 
In this stunning, move‑in 
ready 2021 farmhouse in 
Red Fox Ridge’s private 
gated community. Enjoy 
2711 sq.ft. of exquisite de- 
sign: 4 beds, 2.5 baths, 
open flow with vaulted ceil- 
ings & custom beams. The 
gourmet kitchen inspires 
with dual ovens & a large 
island, perfect for gather- 
ings in the adjacent dining 
area. Enjoy a luxurious pri- 
mary suite, entertain with 
the bonus room with a bar. 
Relish outdoor serenity on 
the 0.51‑acre corner lot. 
$1,049,999. Open House, 
Saturday, May 17, 3pm‑ 
5pm. 2539 S Man O War 
Ln, Veradale. Call Rich 
Prasser with Keller 
Williams, 509‑435‑3287

OLDER DOUBLEWIDE 
MARLETTE MANUFAC- 
TURED HOME
3 bedrooms, 2 baths, in ex- 
cellent condition, newer 
roof & newer furnace 
within the last 3 years, 
needs to be moved off it’s 
current lot in Post Falls, 
$50,000. Also have 10 
beautiful acres near Long 
Lake that would be a great 
location for it for 
$140,000. Call or text 
Doug for more informa- 
tion on the home or the 
land. 509‑821‑0513

WE BUY MOBILE & MAN- 
UFACTURED HOMES!
Call today! 1 Call Home 
Services, 509‑979‑4575

WILDER AFFORDABLE 
HOMES  HAS SOME OF 
THE BEST FLOOR PLANS
Around! Check the design 
of our closets, bathrooms, 
kitchens. We just do things 
differently at Wilder. 
Come see us at 18804 E. 
Broadway, Spokane Val- 
ley. www.WilderAfford- 
ableHomesSpokane.com 
509‑822‑1850

NOW APPROVED IN 
WASHINGTON!
Lower your heating bills & 
enjoy smoke‑free indoor 
comfort with the proven 
technology of a Classic 
Edge Titanium HDX out- 
door wood furnace. For a 
limited time, up to $3400 
in savings. Call DIWH 
Heating today for details! 
208‑946‑5550 
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4427 W Shawnee Ave, Spokane
5 Bed, 3 Bath - Fully Remodeled
$565,000
Lizzy Sartin, 509-521-3064
John L Scott, Inc.

Thurs, 5/15, 4:30-6:30pm & Sat, 5/17, 11am-1pm

12719 W. Greenfield Road, Nine Mile Falls
Spacious 4 bed, 3 bath, 1.35 acre lot
$795,000
Sue Palmer, 509-435-2745
Real Estate Marketplace NW, Inc. 

Saturday, May 17, 10am-12pm

11810 N Peridot Dr, Hayden
3 Bed, 2.5 Bath - Amazing Family Home
$575,000
Lisa Ciraulo, 208-967-3285
NextHome 365 Realty

Saturday, May 17, 1pm-3pm

4117 W Wellesley Ave, Spokane
3 Bed, 1 Bath - Charming Audubon Home
$317,900
John Rice, 253-347-1986
Amplify Real Estate Services

Saturday, May 17, 10am-12pm

1113 S Bannen Rd., Spokane Valley
3 Bed, 2 Bath - 2020 Build
$449,000
Amberlyn Parker, 509-995-7619
Keller Williams Spokane

Saturday, May 17, 1pm-4pm

13013 E 22nd Ave, Spokane
4 Bed, 2 Bath - Valley Rancher
$440,000
Allison Aahl, 425-679-1621 & Rich 
Prasser, 509-435-3287, Keller Williams

Sat, 5/17, 11am-1pm & Sun, 5/18, 11am-1pm

2539 S Man O War Ln, Veradale
4 Bed, 3 Bath - Luxury Farmhouse
$1,049,999
Rich Prasser, 509-435-3287
Keller Williams

Saturday, May 17, 3pm-5pm

2211 W Rowan Ave, Spokane
3 Bed, 2 Bath - Updated Home
$300,000
Ruslan Shmidt, 509-873-9464 
eXp Realty, LLC

Sat, 5/17, 12-2pm & Sun, 5/18, 1-3pm

576 W Myriah Loop, Coeur d’Alene
2 Bed, 2 Bath - 55+ Community
$140,000
Listed by Lisa Ciraulo; Erik Linder, 
208-610-7776, NextHome 365 Realty

Sunday, May 18, 1pm-3pm

1509 W Courtland Ave, Spokane
5 Bed, 4 Bath - Amazing Views
$709,900
John Rice, 253-347-1986 
Amplify Real Estate Services

Sunday, May 18, 1pm-3pm

304 S Conklin Rd Lot 38, Veradale
3 Bed, 2 Bath - 55+ Community
$230,000
Elizabeth Daugherty, 509-209-7908 
Professional Realty Services

Sat, 5/17, & Sun, 5/18, 12pm-3pm

Our Convenient Clip & Carry Index,  
Cut It Out & Find a House!

OPEN HOUSE 
HIT LIST

Call, Text, or Email us at the Exchange to 
Advertise Your Open House Next Week!

Call/ Text 509-922-3456 
Ads@spokane.Exchange

Year to date for April 2025. Site Built homes on less than 2 acres. 
Housing Snapshot provided by the Coeur d’Alene Regional REALTORS®.  

Data provided by the CDA Multiple Listing Service as of 5/5/25.

MEDIAN HOME PRICE

$543,021

1,001
CURRENT ACTIVE  

RESIDENTIAL LISTINGS

697

99

HOMES SOLD YTD

DAYS ON 
MARKET

4.4% UP
 FROM April 2024

As of 5/5/2025

5.6%  UP
FROM April 2024

1% DOWN
FROM April 2024

COEUR D’ALENE
REGIONAL
REALTORS®

KOOTENAI COUNTY
COEUR D’ALENE
REGIONAL
REALTORS®

CDAREALTORS.COM | 208-667-0664
Data for CDA MLS as of 5/5/2025

april 2025

KOOTENAI COUNTY SINGLE FAMILY HOMES

MARKET SNAPSHOT

 

SPOKANE VALLEY 
RANCHER IN CV 
SCHOOL DISTRICT!
Updates over the last few 
years include paint inside 
& out, new dishwasher, 
range, laminate in kitchen 
& dining area, new carpet 
in the basement. Also, up- 
dated main bath, hard- 
wood floors. 3 beds on the 
main level & a fourth bed- 
room in the basement with 
gas fireplace. Two living 
rooms, plus a spacious 
fenced backyard. Zero‑ 
scape landscaping, ample 
storage. Move in ready! 
$440,000. Open House, 
Saturday, May 17, 11am‑ 
1pm & Sunday, May 18, 
11am‑1pm. 13013 E 22nd 
Ave, Spokane. Call Allison 
Aahl with Keller Williams 
Saturday 425‑679‑1621 & 
call Rich Prasser with 
Keller Williams Sunday 
509‑435‑3287 

 

DISCOVER THIS AWE- 
SOME HOME
With an expansion room 
into a partially finished 
basement, 3‑bedroom, 2 
bathroom home featuring 
an updated modern bath- 
room, a newly tiled base- 
ment, a shop, outdoor 
kitchen. With over 1600 
sq.ft. of living space & an 
additional 300 sq.ft. cov- 
ered porch, there is plenty 
of room to meet your 
lifestyle needs. Outbuild- 
ings include shed, green- 
house & shop. $300,000. 
Open House, Saturday, 
May 17, 12pm‑2pm & Sun- 
day, May 18, 1pm‑3pm. 
2211 W Rowan 
Ave, Spokane. Call Ruslan 
Shmidt with eXp Realty, 
LLC, 509‑873‑9464 

 

BEAUTIFUL SETTING ON 
NEARLY 10 ACRES IN 
DEER PARK
This 5 bedroom, 4 bath- 
room home offers new 
hardwood floors, newer 
roof, new 100 gpm well, &  
the perfect blend of rural 
tranquility & modern con- 
venience. 8715 W. Antler 
Road. Offered at 
$829,000 by Jeff Hun- 
saker & Tami Rae Meador, 
Windermere. 509‑701‑ 
0690 https://www.tourfac- 
tory.com/3187274

 

3 BED & 1 BATH HOME 
IN AUDUBON NEIGH- 
BORHOOD
Fully updated in 2018 with 
modern plumbing & elec- 
trical systems for peace of 
mind. This inviting resi- 
dence features freshly re- 
finished hardwood floors 
in the hall & living room, 
paired with large vinyl win- 
dows that fill the home 
with natural light. The up- 
dated kitchen boasts con- 
temporary finishes & a gas 
range, perfect for home 
cooking. $317,900. Open 
House, Saturday, May 17, 
10am‑12pm. 4117 W 
Wellesley Ave, Spokane. 
Call John Rice, with Am- 
plify Real Estate Services, 
253‑347‑1986 

ACREAGE PROPERTIES 
AVAILABLE!
XX W. Sidney Road, 9.80 
acres, $165,000; XXXX N. 
Spotted Road, 10 acres, 
$175,000. 17306 N Dart- 
ford Dr., Spokane 1.63 
acres with Dartford Creek 
running through it, 
$215,000 . Call Barb Frye 
with Amplify Real Estate 
Services, 509‑220‑4373

METALINE FALLS, WA 
BEAUTIFUL DOWN- 
TOWN APARTMENT
Post Office building, across 
from Busta Park, 2 bed- 
room, 1 bath, water, sewer 
& garbage included, $925/ 
month plus deposit, other 
units available. 208‑610‑ 
9220

PAYING TOP CASH FOR 
USED MOBILE HOMES
& manufactured homes 
newer than 1980. 509‑ 
939‑8820

WE BUY LAND
All sizes, Washington & 
Idaho. Frontier Northwest 
Land, 509‑468‑0483

WESLEY FINANCIAL 
GROUP, LLC 
Timeshare cancellation ex- 
perts over $50,000,000 in 
timeshare debt & fees can- 
celled in 2019. Get free 
info package & learn how 
to get rid of your time- 
share! Free consultations. 
Over 450 positive reviews. 
833‑308‑1971

SPOKANE VALLEY 
CONDO TO LEASE OR 
BUY
2 bedroom, 2 bath with 
den, great Spokane Valley 
views, fully furnished, 2 
garages, price negotiable, 
call to discuss and/ or in- 
spect. 509‑953‑8971 
leave name & phone num- 
ber if no answer

 

METICULOUSLY MAIN- 
TAINED 2020 BUILD
The convenient location & 
low annual maintenance, 
make this a great home for 
anyone needing to take a 
breath. Enjoy a drink on 
the back deck while taking 
in the beautiful mountain 
views. The low mainte- 
nance yard is fully 
equipped with under- 
ground sprinklers & a wa- 
ter feature to enjoy. A 
Smart Home system is in- 
stalled & ready for the 
next buyer. Come see ev- 
erything this clean & easy 
home has to offer. 
$449,000. 
MLS#: 202515482. Open 
House, Saturday, May 17, 
1pm‑4pm. 1113 S Bannen 
Rd., Spokane Valley. Call 
Amberlyn Parker with 
Keller Williams Spokane, 
509‑995‑7619

MOVING? CONSIDER A 
SHIPPING CONTAINER
Buy, customize or rent. 
Convenient & secure on- 
site storage. Locally 
owned & operated. Call to- 
day for more information. 
Clark’s Containers 509‑ 
992‑6692 www.- 
ClarksContainers.com

PLACE YOUR AD
In the Exchange! Call 509-
922-3456
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CASH, AS-IS, NO FEES.

HomeRunTeamSpokane.com

Call Us Today!

15906 E Sprague 
Spokane Valley, WA
509-481-9830

3335 Travel Plaza Way 
Pasco, WA

BRAND NEW  
DOUBLE WIDE

$124,455
3 Bed, 2 Bath Includes Delivery & Set-up

• 2x6 Walls
• Energy Star Insulation
• Stainless Steel  
   Appliances
• 1 piece Shower
• 1 Piece Tub
• Hardwood Cabinets
• 80# Roof

TAKE A VIRTUAL TOUR
of this             Home!Beautiful

Living Room

Bath Primary 
Bedroom

Kitchen DiningBedroom 
3

Bedroom 
2 Utility

#1 RETAILER! LARGEST IN WASHINGTON
Our Online Pricing Includes Delivery & Set Up

I HAVE MONEY TO 
LEND. QUICK CLOSING, 
NO CREDIT CHECK
Money to lend on homes, 
land, commercial & invest- 
ment property. No owner 
occupied. Fix & flip, rehab, 
and buy & hold. I also buy 
properties! Contact me for 
all your real estate finance 
needs. For a quick re- 
sponse, please e‑mail the 
scenario to Dan 
dg8603@gmail.com or 
call/ text, 509‑217‑2456

 

HAVE TO SEE THIS NEW 
& BEAUTIFUL ENERGY 
STAR DOUBLE WIDE
Located in the friendly 
neighborhood of Birch 
Tree Manor, a 55+ commu- 
nity. 1300 approximate sq.- 
ft. of convenience & com- 
fort. 3 bedrooms, 2 full 
bathrooms, with walk‑in 
shower in the primary. 50 
gallon water heater, hard- 
wood cabinets & more! 
Outside is a sprinkler sys- 
tem, a large shed, garden 
beds & a fenced yard. With 
extra parking space avail- 
able. The community is 
family‑owned. There is a 
fun clubhouse to enjoy 
Bingo, cards, parties, or to 
relax. RV storage is avail- 
able. $230,000. Open 
House, Saturday, May 17, 
& Sunday, May 18, 12pm‑ 
3pm. 304 S Conklin Rd 
LOT 38, Veradale. Eliza- 
beth Daugherty with Pro- 
fessional Realty Services, 
509‑209‑7908

 

THEY JUST DON’T MAKE 
THEM LIKE THIS ANY- 
MORE!
Featuring 3 bedrooms, 2.5 
bathrooms, 2 spacious liv- 
ing rooms & an unfinished 
basement. Enjoy the bene- 
fits of a 50‑year roof & a 
solid layout, ready for your 
personal touch. With no 
HOA & light CCRs, plus 
proximity to Honeysuckle 
Beach, Hayden Lake, boat 
launches & golf courses, 
this home is perfect for 
first‑time buyers, in- 
vestors, or those seeking a 
renovation project. Short‑ 
term & long‑term rentals 
allowed! $575,000. Open 
House, Saturday, May 17, 
1pm‑3pm. 11810 N Peri- 
dot Dr, Hayden. Call Lisa 
Ciraulo with NextHome 
365 Realty, 208‑967‑3285

 

12,000 SQ.FT BUILDING 
ON 14 ACRES IN 
STEVENS COUNTY
Insulated 70x175’ shop 
with 3 insulated overhead 
doors & 3 services doors, 
90% complete. Building is 
roofed & sided, just bring 
your concrete guy & dry 
waller & finish it your way! 
Sub panels installed, new 
high LED lighting, ceiling 
fans, 4 bathrooms roughed 
in, overhead propane 
heaters, fiber optics in 
place. Property is zoned 
for special use permit for 
business, additional 
18x28’ garage, $774,000. 
Call Joe Penny for all the 
details on this amazing 
property! Real Estate Mar- 
ketplace NW, Inc. 509‑ 
701‑5464

LOOKING TO SELL 
CEDAR LOGS?
Call Alta Forest Products. 
Delivered to Naples, Idaho 
& Swan Lake Landing, St. 
Maries, Idaho. Now also 
delivering to Port of Lewis- 
ton, Idaho. Call Trevor 
Favaro, 208‑290‑4547 or 
Luke Machtolf, CF. 509‑ 
867‑6313

PANHANDLE MOBILE 
HOME MOVERS
We offer tear down, setup 
& re‑leveling. Other ser- 
vices provided, mobile cer- 
tified welding & fabrica- 
tion services. We also 
move tiny homes. Serving 
ID, WA, MT & OR. Call for 
free estimates, 509‑202‑ 
3177

 

TINY HOME $66,000
399 sq.ft., main floor bed- 
room, appliances, furniture 
& wood stove included, 
must be moved, reputable 
professional builder. 509‑ 
993‑9199 Medical Lake 

ALL REAL ESTATE AD- 
VERTISING
In this newspaper is sub- 
ject to the Federal Fair 
Housing Act of 1968 
which makes it illegal to ad- 
vertise any preference, lim- 
itation or discrimination 
based on race, color, reli- 
gion, sex or national origin, 
or an intention to make 
any such preference, limi- 
tation or discrimination. 
This newspaper will not 
knowingly accept any ad- 
vertising for real estate 
which is in violation of the 
law. Our readers are 
hereby informed that all 
dwellings advertised in 
this newspaper are avail- 
able on an equal opportu- 
nity basis. To complain of 
discrimination, call HUD 
Toll‑free at 800‑669‑9777

 

WE BUY HOUSES FOR 
CASH, AS‑IS, NO FEES
We save you time & en- 
ergy, no repairs or clean 
up necessary! Get fast 
cash for houses & land, call 
for your free offer today! 
Home Run Team, Al & Jen 
509‑342‑9929 or Home- 
RunTeamSpokane.com

 

NESTLED IN SPOKANE’S 
VIBRANT GARLAND DIS- 
TRICT
This expansive 4,000+ 
square foot home offers 
breathtaking, unob- 
structed city views from 
its elevated perch. Situ- 
ated on a generous lot, the 
property provides ample 
space for outdoor enjoy- 
ment, gardening, or future 
customization. Inside, 
gleaming hardwood floors 
flow throughout, enhanc- 
ing the home’s timeless 
charm & warmth. The 
gourmet kitchen is a chef’s 
dream, featuring a profes- 
sional‑grade Viking gas 
range, perfect for creating 
culinary masterpieces. 
With multiple living areas, 
spacious bedrooms & abun- 
dant natural light, this 
home is designed for com- 
fort & versatility. Enjoy the 
best of urban living with 
nearby shops, cafes &  en- 
tertainment, all while sa- 
voring the tranquility of 
your private retreat. A 
rare opportunity to own a 
distinctive property in one 
of Spokane’s most sought‑ 
after neighborhoods. 
$709,900. Open House, 
Sunday, May 18, 1pm‑ 
3pm. 1509 W Courtland 
Ave, Spokane. Call John 
Rice, with Amplify Real Es- 
tate Services, 253‑347‑ 
1986 

 

FULLY REMODELED 5 
BED & 3 BATH MID‑CEN- 
TURY MODERN HOME
Located in a peaceful 
neighborhood, within walk- 
ing distance of the local el- 
ementary school and just 
minutes from shopping 
and amenities. Recent up- 
dates include fresh inte- 
rior and exterior paint, 
new flooring and carpet, as 
well as fully renovated 
bathrooms and kitchen. 
The modern kitchen fea- 
tures all matching stainless 
steel appliances. Smart 
home technology is inte- 
grated throughout. Down- 
stairs, there is a second liv- 
ing space, an oversized 
laundry room, bedrooms, 
and a playroom. Addition- 
ally, there is an indoor 
sauna for relaxation. Don’t 
miss the tranquil backyard 
and RV parking. $565,000. 
Open House, Thursday, 
May 15, 4:30pm‑6:30pm 
& Saturday, May 17, 11am‑ 
1pm. 4427 W Shawnee 
Ave, Spokane. Call Lizzy 
Sartin, John L Scott, Inc., 
509‑521‑3064 

REVERSE MORTGAGE
A Better Way to Retire! 
Call 208‑762‑6887. Local 
representative, free infor- 
mation. Larry Waters, 
NMLS #400451. Mutual of 
Omaha Mortgage, NMLS 
#1025894. (These materi- 
als are not from, or ap- 
proved by, HUD or FHA. 
Subject to Credit Ap- 
proval.) M00MR.1219.23. 
Equal Housing Lender. 
Serving Idaho & Washing- 
ton

PLACE YOUR AD
In the Exchange! Call 509-
922-3456

WESLEY FINANCIAL 
GROUP, LLC 
Timeshare cancellation ex- 
perts over $50,000,000 in 
timeshare debt & fees can- 
celled in 2019. Get free 
info package & learn how 
to get rid of your time- 
share! Free consultations. 
Over 450 positive reviews. 
833‑308‑1971

WE BUY LAND
All sizes, Washington & 
Idaho. Frontier Northwest 
Land, 509‑468‑0483
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“Going fast is your job...Telling people about it is ours...!”

The Chinn family have been having recent 
success on the drag strip at Renegade Race-
way in Wapato, Wash.

On Friday May 2, Charlee Chinn ran her first 
drag race ever at Renegade’s Diesel Truck 
Drags and came in first place in the pickup 
truck category. That’s Damien with Charlee.

Then on Saturday, May 10, racing at the 
5th annual Funny Car Frenzy, Damien Chinn 
earned first place in the No Box class on for 
the first Gambler’s race of the season. It was 
only his third race on the motorcycle and is 
pictured with Junior Chinn.

KANSAS CITY, Kan. (May 11, 2025)—
Last year, Kyle Larson won the spring race 
at Kansas Speedway by the thinnest of mar-
gins—0.001 seconds in the closest finish in 
NASCAR Cup Series history.

On Sunday, after putting his No. 5 Hendrick 
Motorsports Chevrolet on the pole on Satur-
day, Larson defended his victory in far more 
decisive fashion, leading 221 of 267 laps in 
winning the AdventHealth 400 at the 1.5-mile 
track.

The triumph was Larson’s third of the sea-
son, tying race runner-up Christopher Bell for 
most in the series so far this year. The win was 
Larson’s third at Kansas and the 32nd of his 
career, tying NASCAR Hall of Famer Dale 
Jarrett for 29th on the career list.’

“Great car, great execution today, too, for 
our team,” said Larson, who now will start to 
concentrate on the Indianapolis 500/Coca-Co-
la 600 double he’ll attempt for the second 
time later this month.

Sweeping the first and second stages, Lar-
son now has eight stage wins this season, a 
record for the first 12 Cup races of a season. 
His stage sweep was the 14th of his career.

Larson now leads the series standings by 35 
points over Hendrick Motorsports teammate 
William Byron, who finished 24th after fall-
ing off the lead lap with an early flat tire.

The colossal numbers, however, don’t tell 
the full story. At the end of the final 49 lap 
green-flag run, Larson had to manage his 
right-side tires, and his advantage over Bell 

shrank from a comfortable two seconds to just 
0.712 seconds at the finish line.

Closing fast in third, Ryan Blaney finished 
just 0.832 seconds behind the race winner.

“I was trying really hard to pace myself, be-
cause I believe that was our longest run of the 
day,” Larson said. “I’d been struggling a little 
bit at the end of the runs.”

Chase Briscoe ran fourth for the fourth time 
this season. Alex Bowman scraped the wall 
in the closing laps and held fifth ahead of 
Ford drivers Josh Berry, Ryan Preece, Chris 
Buescher and Joey Logano.

The race featured seven cautions—four in 
the final stage—for a total of 37 laps. Elliott 
led 29 laps, the only driver other than Larson 
to lead more than four.

CHINN’S WINNING

LARSON DOMINATES, DEFENDS AT KANSAS
By Reid Spencer, NASCAR Wire Service 

Charlee Chinn with Damien Chinn.  
Lynette Chinn photos

Damien Chinn with Junior Chinn.  
Lynette Chinn photos

Kyle Larson, driver of the #5 HendrickCars.com 
Chevrolet, celebrates in victory lane after winning 
the NASCAR Cup Series AdventHealth 400 at 
Kansas Speedway on May 11, 2025 in Kansas 
City, Kansas. NASCAR Photos

Paul Delaney has been writing about Motorsports in the Pacific Northwest since 1976. 
He welcomes learning about your racing accomplishments. 

Ask us how we can help YOU! 509-220-8018 | nwmotorsportsreport@gmail.com

PLACE YOUR AD 24/7PLACE YOUR AD 24/7

 Create an Account
 See past ads; edit & renew them
 Pay online with your credit card  
 Easy & convenient!

5111 E Trent Ave, Spokane
Call: 509-922-3456  Text: 509-998-3231 www.PacificNW.Exchange 

with 
our New Online AdForm!

Go to www.PacificNW.Exchange/AdForm/

1975 CHEVY C6000
Runs good, 350 V8, no 
flatbed, $750. Call 509‑ 
710‑6760 Loon Lake

1916‑1990 LICENSE 
PLATES
Washington, Idaho, Mon- 
tana, Oregon, register 
your vintage year license 
plates to the same year 
auto, pay only a one time 
fee. 509‑926‑9266; 509‑ 
999‑9855 Spokane, 
dlee40@comcast.net

 

2007 ACURA MDX 
SPORT PACKAGE AWD
Dependable SUV, stylish & 
comfortable, excellent con- 
dition inside & out, loaded, 
heated front & second row 
seats, also has third row 
seating, great CarFax with 
consistent maintenance, 
clean title, 142,000 miles, 
$5995. Call us today for a 
test drive! www.V8AutoS- 
ales.com, 6612 N. Market, 
Spokane. 509‑866‑1313

 

2000 JIMMY SLE 
4x4, V6, automatic, loaded, 
motor has 146,000 miles, 
transmission serviced, 
tinted windows, tow pack- 
age, decent tires, runs & 
drives good, $1795 or best 
offer. 509‑489‑5286 
Spokane

 

2013 TOYOTA TUNDRA 
4x4, 4 door, V8, #12029, 
$16,930. Call or come test 
drive, TK Auto Sales, 6904 
E Sprague Ave, Spokane. 
509‑242‑3588

2000 CROWN VICTORIA 
POLICE INTERCEPTOR 
Police vehicle, clean ride, 
power steering, power 
brakes, automatic, newer 
21” MKW chrome wheels, 
newer tires, 4.6L, runs 
good, $3000. Call Paul 
509‑979‑6546 Spokane

 

2013 FORD FOCUS SE
4 cylinder, automatic, 
loaded, tinted, windows, 
decent tires, cold A/C, oil 
changed, highway miles, 
runs & drives good, $1895 
or best offer. 509‑489‑ 
5286 Spokane

1974 OLDSMOBILE 
DELTA 88 CONVERTIBLE
Runs good, needs a new 
top, $3700; Also 2001 Sat- 
urn SC2 Coupe, red, 
139,000 miles, $2500. Call 
509‑710‑6760 Loon Lake

2007 GMC SIERRA 
PICKUP, FLATBED
4 door, runs & looks good, 
300,000 miles, turbo will 
need to be replaced, 
$6500 or best offer. 2000 
Toyota Tacoma 4WD, runs 
& looks good, standard 
transmission, 200,000 
miles, $8500 firm. Call & 
leave message, 509‑843‑ 
3359 Clarkston

 1995 FORD F‑450 FLAT 
BED 
133,000 miles, great & 
hard‑working truck, farm 
truck, manual transmis- 
sion, gas engine, $4000 or 
best offer. 509‑290‑3874 
Mead

THE GREAT NORTH- 
WEST GATHERING CAR 
SHOW IS AT A NEW
Location this year, the 
Coeur d’Alene Casino in 
Worley, Idaho. Friday, Au- 
gust 8 & Saturday, August 
9, online registration 
opens May 20, in‑person 
registration, August 8. Sat- 
urday show, 8am; awards 
at 5pm. Live band, beer 
garden, special hotel room 
rates. Register at www.- 
GreatNWGathering.com

 

1994 JEEP WRANGLER
The best Jeep you’ll ever 
own, original fiberglass 
hard top, 245,000 miles, 
standard transmission, 4L 
engine, stock height, all 
maintenance up to date, 
ready to customize to your 
specifications, $6000. Call 
or text 509‑833‑5764 Ch- 
eney

 

1999 JIMMY SLE 
4x4, V6, automatic, 
153,000 miles, loaded, 
tinted windows, plush inte- 
rior, good tires, nice 4x4, 
runs & drives excellent, 
new water pump, $2295 
or best offer. 509‑489‑ 
5286 

 

2015 CHEVY MALIBU LT
Only 84,000 miles, auto, 
power windows, power 
locks, #11944 $11,915 
Call or come test drive, TK 
Auto Sales, 6904 E 
Sprague Ave, Spokane. 
509‑242‑3588

 

2005 3500 CHEVROLET 
4x4 
Dually crew cab long box 
pick up, Duramax Allison, 
177,000 miles, great 
shape, $19,500 or best of- 
fer. 208‑310‑0636 
Moscow

DONATE YOUR CAR TO 
VETERANS TODAY!
Help & Support our Veter- 
ans. Fast, free pick up. 
100% tax deductible. Call 
1‑800‑245‑0398

 

2018 JEEP COMPASS
4x4, manual transmission, 
power window, power 
locks, AC, #12056, 
$11,430. Call or come test 
drive, TK Auto Sales, 6904 
E Sprague Ave, Spokane. 
509‑242‑3588
 

VETERAN OWNED MUF- 
FLER & EXHAUST REPAIR
By Mike Turley. Call us for 
free estimates or check 
out appointment. Super 
sounds & custom work. Su- 
per Sound Muffler & Ex- 
haust located in Athol, 
Idaho. Call 208‑660‑5852

VETERAN OWNED MUF- 
FLER & EXHAUST REPAIR
By Mike Turley. Call us for 
free estimates or check 
out appointment. Super 
sounds & custom work. Su- 
per Sound Muffler & Ex- 
haust located in Athol, 
Idaho. Call 208‑660‑5852

 

1997 DODGE DAKOTA 
SLT
2WD, extra cab, magnum 
V6, automatic, loaded, sun- 
roof, oil changed, 158,000 
miles, cold A/C, decent 
tires, runs & drives good, 
$1895 or best offer. 509‑ 
489‑5286 

PLACE YOUR AD
In the Exchange! Call 509-
922-3456
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May 15 - June 7

 2025 
CALENDAR 
OF EVENTS

MAY 15-17   
Lost in the 50’s
First Ave and Cedar St - Sandpoint, ID
Thur: Welcome Party, Fri: Cruise, Sat: Car Show
206-406-2421, Facebook: Lostinthe50s.com

MAY 15    
SMS Monthly Summer Car Meet
1217 Washington Ave - Sandpoint, ID 6pm
208-290-2779, SMSautomarine@gmail.com
SMSAutoMarine.com

MAY 16-17   
Waitsburg Celebration Days Auto Show
Preston Park - Waitsburg, WA
Fri: Cruise 6pm, Sat: Car Show 10am
509-301-9688

MAY 17    
Annual Harrington Car Show
9 N 3rd St - Harrington, WA 9am
208-882-6563

Coffee & Cars @ Killer Burger
Prairie Shopping Center - Hayden, ID 1pm
206-660-1023, 425-290-2003
Facebook: Idaho Hot Rod Hall of Fame

Spokane Lilac Festival Annual Cruisin the Falls 
Car Show
Spokane Falls Blvd & Howard St - Spokane, WA
9am-2pm, 509-535-4554, SpokaneLilacFestival.org

MAY 17-18   
52nd Annual Monroe Auto Swap Meet
Evergreen State Fairgrounds
4405 179th Ave SE - Monroe, WA 8am
www.MonroeSwapmeet.com

MAY 18    
American Reflections 25th Annual Open  
Car Show
Moxee Park - Moxee, WA 9am-3pm
509-965-2547, 509-575-1776

MAY 23-25   
7th Annual Tigers on the Columbia
Rocky Reach Dam/ Convention Center
Wenatchee, WA
Ted Knapp, 425-681-9682

MAY 23-26   
54th Annual Big Sky Corvette Meet
Heritage INN - Great Falls, MT
Fri: 3pm, Sat: 7am, Sun: 7am
406-781-2694, BigSkyCorvetteMeet.com

MAY 24    
Otis Days Car and Motorcycle Show
22000 E Wellesley Ave - Otis Orchards, WA
Parade Lineup: 10am, Car Show: 11:30am
509-389-9785, artudel@juno.com
Register at www.RealLifeOtis.church

24th Annual Marty Bourassa Open Show
Southgate Mall - 2901 Brooks St - Missoula, MT
9am-4pm, 406-626-4401, 406-240-3889

Ritzville United Car Show
213 W Main Ave - Ritzville, WA 9am
509-659-0911, ritzvilleunited@gmial.com

MAY 24    
Nostalgia Days Car Show
Chewelah Park - Chewelah, WA 9am
509-991-1531, schwartzme@hotmail.com

MAY 25    
Pacific Northwest Mustang Club 43rd Spring 
Show and Shine
Columbia Park - Kennewick, WA 9am
509-521-3693, 509-539-7704
Facebook: Facebook.com/PNWMclub

Odessa PTO Car Show
Corner of 1st Ave & Division St - Odessa, WA
8:30am, 509-988-0259
odessatigerspto@gmail.com

MAY 31    
21st Annual Hot Rod Gathering
Downtown Palouse - Palouse, WA 11am
208-301-4691, 208-301-0018
j_lopy_kid@mailknucklerapers.com

Northport International Raceway 2025 Race
Big Sheep Creek Road, Northport, WA
509-675-8618, MaxDTR.com

JUNE 1    
3rd Annual Shadle Park Car Show
4327 N Ash St - Spokane, WA 10am
509-991-3854, 509-202-5092
chevygraham69@gmail.com

JUNE 6    
Classy Chassy 2025
Downtown Kennewick - Kennewick, WA 7am
509-551-6129, 509-582-7221
tnluv70@yahoo.com

SOVREN’S Premier Inland Northwest Event 
Vintage Motor Racing
Qlispe Raceway - 750 Hayford Rd  
Airway Heights, WA, 509-994-1706, 509-468-1237
threeamigos46@hotmail.com, 
SpokaneFestivalofSpeed.org

Neighbor Day at Cannon Park
1920 W Maxwell Ave - Spokane, WA 4pm-6:30pm
509-999-2626, rharris@westcentralcc.org

JUNE 7    
Rod Bender Border 3 Jamboree
Main St - Bonners Ferry, ID 8am
208-603-0617, 208-603-0738
Facebook: Bonners Ferry Rod Benders

2025 Spring Fling AutoNation Open Car Show
8500 E Sprague Ave - Spokane Valley 9am
509-981-1282, 661-212-4054
pinman@attglobal.net, gentsautoclub@gmail.com

Reardan Mule Days
City Park - Maple St, Reardan, WA 9am
509-290-0320, 206-399-4848
www.ReardanMuleDays.com

26th Annual Old Schoolhouse Rock Car Show
River St - Superior, MT 8am
406-370-2188, Facebook: OSR Car Show

To Feature Your Car Event, Email ComingEvents@PacificNW.Exchange

Due to unexpected changes in events, it is strongly suggested that you 
contact the event coordinator prior to attending. 

MONDAY
Paul Bunyan
8625 N Government Way
Hayden, ID 
Ponderosa Bar & Grill
11205 E Dishman Mica Rd
Spokane, WA

TUESDAY
Ferraro’s Italian Restaurant
11204 E Sprague Avenue
Spokane Valley, WA

WEDNESDAY
Paul Bunyan
13735 Hwy 53, Rathdrum, ID
Kalispel Casino
420 Qlispe River Way
Cusick, WA

THURSDAY
Ron’s Drive In 
12502 E Sprague Ave
Spokane Valley, WA

Directed by 
Riverside City 

Cruisers

MAY 30-31
NITRO FUNNY CARS
BB FUNNY CARS
BLOWN ALCOHOL THUNDER

THUNDER NIGHTS

Find solution to this puzzle in this issue

SUDOKU

Level: Intermediate

2013 35’ KEYSTONE 
COUGAR 
Model number 32 
RBKWE, lots to list, asking 
$12,500 or best offer. For 
more information & pic- 
tures, please call or text 
509‑671‑1352 Newport 

 

LANCE TRUCK CAMPER 
1121
11’6”, outdoor cover, solar 
generator, outdoor 
shower, stereo & TV, dry 
shower, microwave, oven, 
bike rack, completely self 
contained. 208‑304‑3488 
Sandpoint

NOW BUYING OLD MO- 
TORCYCLES & PARTS
Dependable, reliable ser- 
vice. Call Good Guys Tow- 
ing, 509‑218‑2190 
Spokane

HARLEY DAVIDSON MO- 
TORCYCLE 
2016 Harley Davidson 
X6750, cherry red, 6333 
miles, excellent condition, 
always garaged, $4250 or 
best offer. Call for pic- 
tures, 509‑994‑1448 or 
email me at davidhen- 
ry7489@gmail.com

 

2002 BMW R1150R
Sport touring bike, 70,000 
miles, excellent condition, 
recent rebuild on Ohlins 
shocks, hard saddle bags, 
tank & tail bags, very nice 
& ready to go, $3250 or 
best offer cash. Call & 
leave a message 509‑939‑ 
6833 Spokane 

2016 HARLEY DAVID- 
SON STREET GLIDE 
103, denim black with red 
pin striping, lowers with 
speakers, auxiliary lights, 
backrest for passenger & 
rider, other extras, 
$12,000. 509‑833‑5437

 

2016 HARLEY DAVID- 
SON FLHTKL ULTRA LIM- 
ITED LOW
3408 original miles, 
“Bright Ass” tail light, cup 
holders, passenger arm 
rests & other add ons, im- 
maculate! $19,000. Call 
775‑690‑4603 Veradale

 

SPRAGUE MOTEL & RV 
PARK, OPEN YEAR 
ROUND!
Daily, weekly & monthly 
rates available, call us for 
current rates! Located 30 
minutes from Spokane, full 
RV hookups, 30amp & 
50amp power, free Wi‑Fi, 
laundry facility, bathrooms 
with showers, common 
area with picnic tables, 
BBQs, propane available. 
Near Sprague Lake for lots 
of fishing, hunting & recre- 
ation! For information, call 
509‑257‑2615 www.- 
SpragueMotelRV.com

RV SITES AVAILABLE 
ON CHEWELAH OUT- 
SKIRTS 
Full hookups, reasonable 
rates. For inquiries, call 
509‑935‑4866 

PLACE YOUR AD
In the Exchange! Call 509-
922-3456


